N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

GOVERNMENT OF MADHYA PRADESH
WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT
Appendix 2.10

(Works Department Manual 1983)
Tender Document

For Percentage Rate only in Works Department and other Departments
similar to Works Department
(Effective from 01/01/2014)

(Effective From 01-01.2014)

Bhopal
Government of Central Press




N.LT. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-Cle-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
SECTION 1

Notice Inviting e-Tenders

Government of Madhya Pradesh

Water Resources Department

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Online percentage rate bids for the following works are invited from registered

contractors and firms of repute fulfilling registration criteria:

S. Work District(s) Probable Completion
No./Pkg/Code Amount Period (months)
2026 WRD | Hiring of 06 highly skilled | SAGAR 14.99 Within 12
494630 1 workers (drivers) in the Months

financial year 2026-27 for
operation of government
machinery under E/M
Heavy Machinery Division,
Sagar.

1. Interested bidders can view the NIT on website https://www.mtenders.gov.in.

2. The Bid Document can be purchased only online from

(time) 17:30 (date).

(time) 10:30 (date) to

3. Amendments to NIT, if any, would be published on website only, and not in newspaper.

Executive Engineer
E/M Heavy Machinery
Water Resources Division
Sagar (M.P.)




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Government of Madhya Pradesh

Notice Inviting Tender

Water Resources Department

Office of the Executive Engineer
E/M H.E.M. Division, Water Resources Department,Sagar

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Online percentage rate bids for the following works are invited from registered

contractors and firms of repute fulfilling registration criteria:

cost on the website.

Credit/Debit/Cash Card/internet banking.

i) pay the cost of Bid Document;

ii) deposit the Earnest Money;

iii) Submit a check list; and

iv) Submit an affidavit.

Details can be seen in the Bid Data Sheet.

ELIGIBILTY FOR BIDDERS:

At the time of submission of the Bid the eligible bidder shall be required to:

S. No. Name of Work District Probable Earnest Money | Cost of Bid | Category Period of
/Pkg/ (s) Amount of Deposit (EMD) | Document of Completion
Code Contract (In Rupees) (In Rupees) | Contract | (in Months)
(In Rs. ) without or
gst
2026 | Hiring of 06 highly Within 12
WRD_ | skilled workers (drivers) | SAGA | 14 99 292/- 30000/- 2000/- “c Months
494630 | in the financial year R
1 2026-27 for operation of
B government machinery
under E/M Heavy
Machinery Division,
Sagar.
1. All details relating to the Bid Document(s) can be viewed and downloaded free of

Bid Document can be purchased after making online payment of portal fees through

(a) At the time of submission of the Bid the bidder should have valid registration

with the Government of Madhya Pradesh, PWD in appropriate class. However,




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
such bidders who are not registered with the Government of Madhya Pradesh

and are eligible for registration can also submit their bids after having applied for

registration with appropriate authority.

(b) The bidder would be required to have valid registration at the time of signing of

the Contract.

(c) Failure to sign the contract by the selected bidder, for whatsoever reason, shall

result in forfeiture of the earnest money deposit.

5. Pre-qualification — Prequalification conditions, wherever applicable, are given in the
Bid Data Sheet.

6. Special Eligibility - Special Eligibility Conditions, if any, are given in the Bid Data
Sheet.
7. The Bid Document can be purchased only online from (time) 10:30 (date) to

(time) 17:30 (date). Other key dates may be seen in bid data sheet.

8. Amendments to NIT, if any, would be published on website only, and not in

newspaper.

Executive Engineer
E/M Heavy Machinery
Water Resources Division
Sagar (M.P.)




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
SECTION 2

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS (ITB)

A. GENERAL

1. SCOPE OF BID

The detailed description of work, hereinafter referred as ‘work’, is given in the Bid
Data Sheet.

2. General Quality of Work:

The work shall have to be executed in accordance with the technical specifications
specified in the Bid Data sheet/ Contract Data, and shall have to meet high standards

of workmanship, safety and security of workmen and works.
3. PROCEDURE FOR PARTICIPATION IN E-TENDERING

The procedure for participation in e-tendering is given in the Bid Data Sheet.
4. ONE BID PER BIDDER

4.1 The bidder can be an individual entity or a joint venture (if permitted as per Bid Data
Sheet). In case the J.V. is permitted, the requirement of joint venture shall be as per
the Bid Data Sheet.

4.2 No bidder shall be entitled to submit more than one bid whether jointly or severally.

If he does so, all bids wherein the bidder has participated shall stand disqualified.
5. Cost of Bidding

The bidder shall bear all costs associated with the preparation and submission of his

bid, and no claim whatsoever for the same shall lie on the Government.
6. Site Visit and examination of works

The bidder is advised to visit and inspect the Site of Works and its surroundings and
obtain for itself on its own responsibility all information that may be necessary for
preparing the bid and entering into a contract for construction of the work. All costs

in this respect shall have to be borne by the bidder.
B. Bid Documents
7. CONTENT OF BID DOCUMENTS
The Bid Document comprises of the following documents:

1. NIT with all amendments.
2. Instructions to Bidders
3. Conditions of Contract:

1. Part I General Conditions of Contract and the Contract Data; and




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

9.1

9.2

9.3

9.4

10.

10.1

10.2
10.3

11.

ii. Part II Special Conditions of Contract.
. Specifications
. Drawings
. Priced Bill of Quantities
. Technical and Financial Bid

. Letter of Acceptance

O 0 9 O »n A

. Agreement, and

10. Any other document(s), as specified.

The bidder is expected to examine carefully all instructions, conditions of contract,
the contract data, forms, terms and specifications, bill of quantities, forms and
drawings in the Bid Document. Bidder shall be solely responsible for his failure to do
sO.

Pre-Bid Meeting (where applicable)
Wherever the Bid Data Sheet provides for pre-bid meeting:

Details of venue, date and time would be mentioned in the Bid Data Sheet. Any
change in the schedule of pre-bid meeting would be communicated on the website

only, and intimation to bidders would not be given separately.

Any prospective bidder may raise his queries and/or seek clarifications in writing
before or during the pre-bid meeting. The purpose of such meeting is to clarify issues
and answer questions on any matter that may be raised at that stage. The Employer

may, at his option, give such clarifications as are felt necessary.

Minutes of the pre-bid meeting including the gist of the questions raised and the
responses given together with any response prepared after the meeting will be

hosted on the website.

Pursuant to the pre-bid meeting if the Employer deems it necessary to amend the

Bid Document, it shall be done by issuing amendment to the online NIT.
Amendment of Bid Documents

Before the deadline for submission of bids, the Employer may amend or modify the

Bid Documents by publication of the same on the website.

All amendments shall form part of the Bid Document.

The Employer may, at its discretion, extend the last date for submission of bids by
publication of the same on the website.

C. Preparation of Bid

The bidders have to prepare their bids online, encrypt their Bid Data in the Bid Forms
and submit Bid Seals (Hashes) of all the envelopes and documents related to the Bid

required to be uploaded as per the time schedule mentioned in the key dates of the




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

12,

13.

14.

14.1

14.2

Notice Inviting e-Tenders after signing of the same by the Digital Signature of their

authorized representative.
DOCUMENTS COMPRISING THE BID
The bid submitted online by the bidder shall be in the following parts:

Part 1 — This shall be known as Online Envelope A and would apply for all bids.
Online Envelop A shall contain the following as per details given in the Bid Data
Sheet:

i) Registration number or proof of application for registration and

organizational details in format given in the Bid Data Sheet.
ii) Payment of the cost of Bid Document;
iii) Earnest Money; and
iv) An affidavit duly notarized.

Part 2 — This shall be known as Online Envelope B and required to be submitted only
in works where pre-qualification conditions and/or special eligibility conditions are
stipulated in the Bid Data Sheet. Online Envelop B shall contain a self-certified sheet
duly supported by documents to demonstrate fulfillment of pre-qualification

conditions.

Part 3 — This shall be known as Online Envelope C and would apply to all bids.
Envelop C shall contain financial offer in the prescribed format enclosed with the Bid

Data Sheet.
Language

The bid as well as all correspondence and documents relating to the bid exchanged
by the Bidder and the Employer shall be in English or Hindi. Supporting documents
and printed literature that are part of the Bid may be in another language provided
they are accompanied by an accurate translation of the relevant passages in English.
In such case, for the purposes of interpretation of the bid, such translation shall

govern.
TECHNICAL PROPOSAL

Only, in case of bids with pre-qualification conditions defined in the Bid Data Sheet,
the Technical Proposal shall comprise of formats and requirements given in the Bid
Data Sheet.

All the documents/ information enclosed with the Technical Proposal should be self-
attested and certified by the bidder. The Bidder shall be liable for forfeiture of his
earnest money deposit, if any document / information are found false/ fake/ untrue

before acceptance of bid. If it is found after acceptance of the bid, the bid




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
sanctioning authority may at his discretion forfeit his performance security/

guarantee, security deposit, enlistment deposit and take any other suitable action.
15. FINANCIAL BID

i. The bidder shall have to quote rates in format referred in Bid Data Sheet, in
overall percentage, and not item wise. If the bid is in absolute amount, overall
percentage would be arrived at in relation to the probable amount of contract

given in NIT. The overall percentage rate would apply for all items of work.

ii.  Percentage shall be quoted in figures as well as in words. If any difference in

figures and words is found, lower of the two shall be taken as valid and correct.

iii. The bidder shall have to quote rates inclusive of all duties, taxes, royalties and

other levies; and the Employer shall not be liable for the same.

iv.  The material along with the units and rates, which shall be issued, if any, by the

department to the contractor, is mentioned in the Bid Data Sheet.
16. PERIOD OF VALIDITY OF BIDS

The bids shall remain valid for a period specified in the Bid Data Sheet after the date
of “close for biding” as prescribed by the Employer. The validity of the bid can be

extended by mutual consent in writing.
17. EARNEST MONEY DEPOSIT (EMD)

17.1 The Bidder shall furnish, as part of the Bid, Earnest Money Deposit (EMD), in the

amount specified in the Bid Data Sheet.

17.2 The EMD shall be in the form of Fixed Deposit Receipt of a scheduled commercial
bank, issued in favour of the name given in the Bid Data Sheet. The Fixed Deposit
Receipt shall be valid for six months or more after the last date of receipt of bids.
However, other form(s) of EMD may be allowed by the Employer by mentioning it in
the Bid Data Sheet.

17.3 Bid not accompanied by EMD shall be liable for rejection as non-responsive.

17.4 EMD of bidders whose bids are not accepted will be returned within ten working
days of the decision on the bid.

17.5 EMD of the successful Bidder will be discharged when the Bidder has signed the

Agreement after furnishing the required Performance Security.

17.6 Failure to sign the contract by the selected bidder, within the specified period, for

whatsoever reason, shall result in forfeiture of the earnest money deposit.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
D. Submission of Bid

18. The bidder is required to submit online bid duly signed digitally, and Envelop ‘A’ in
physical form also at the place prescribed in the Bid Data Sheet.

E. Opening and Evaluation of Bid

19 PROCEDURE

19.1 Envelope ‘A’ shall be opened first and its contents shall be checked. In cases where
Envelop ‘A’ does not contain all requisite documents, such bid shall be treated as

non-responsive, and Envelop B and/or C of such bid shall not be opened.

19.2 Wherever Envelop ‘B’ (Technical Bid) is required to be submitted, the same shall be
opened online at the time and date notified in the Bid Data Sheet. The bidder shall
have freedom to witness opening of the Envelop ‘B’. Envelop ‘C’ (Financial Bid) of

bidders who are not qualified in Technical Bid (Envelop ‘B’) shall not be opened.

19.3 Envelope ‘C’ (Financial Bid) shall be opened online at the time and date notified. The

bidder shall have freedom to witness opening of the Envelop ‘C’.

19.4 After opening Envelop ‘C’ all responsive bids shall be compared to determine the

lowest evaluated bid.

19.5 The Employer reserves the right to accept or reject any bid, and to annul the bidding
process and reject all the bids at any time prior to contract award, without incurring

any liability. In all such cases reasons shall be recorded.

19.6 The Employer reserves the right of accepting the bid for the whole work or for a

distinct part of it.
20. Confidentiality

20.1 Information relating to examination, evaluation, comparison and recommendation
of contract award shall not be disclosed to bidders or any other person not officially

concerned with such process until final decision on the bid.

20.2 Any attempt by a bidder to influence the Employer in the evaluation of the bids or

contract award decisions may result in the rejection of his bid.
F. Award of Contract

21. Award of Contract

The Employer shall notify the successful bidder by issuing a ‘Letter of Acceptance’
(LOA) that his bid has been accepted.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
22. Performance Security
22.1 Prior to signing of the Contract the bidder to whom LOA has been issued shall have
to furnish performance security of the amount in the form and for the duration, etc.
as specified in the Bid Data Sheet.

22.2 Additional performance security, if applicable, is mentioned in the Bid Data Sheet.
23. Signing of Contract Agreement

23.1 The successful bidder shall have to furnish Performance security and sign the

contract agreement within 15 days of issue of LOA.

23.2 The signing of contract agreement shall be reckoned as intimation to
commencement of work. No separate work order shall be issued by the Employer to

the contractor for commencement of work.

23.3 In the event of failure of the successful bidder to submit Performance Security or
sign the Contract Agreement, his EMD shall stand forfeited without prejudice to the
right of the employer for taking any other action against the bidder.

24. CORRUPT PRACTICES

The Employer requires that bidders observe the highest standard of ethics during the

procurement and execution of contracts. In pursuance of this policy, the Employer:

i. may reject the bid for award if it determines that the bidder recommended for
award has, directly or through an agent, engaged in corrupt, fraudulent,

collusive, or coercive practices in competing for the Contract; and

ii. may debar the bidder declaring ineligible, either indefinitely or for a stated
period of time, to participate in bids, if it at any time determines that the
bidder has, directly or through an agent, engaged in corrupt, fraudulent,

collusive, or coercive practices in competing for, or in executing, a contract.

For the purposes of this provision, the terms set forth above are defined as

follows:

a. “corrupt practice” means the offering, giving, receiving, or soliciting,
directly or indirectly, anything of value to influence improperly the

actions of another party;

b. “fraudulent practice” means any act or omission, including a
misrepresentation, that knowingly or recklessly misleads, or attempts to
mislead, a party to obtain a financial or other benefit or to avoid an

obligation;

C. “coercive practice” means impairing or harming, or threatening to impair
or harm, directly or indirectly, any party or the property of the party to

influence improperly the actions of a party;




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
d.  “collusive practice” means an arrangement between two or more parties

designed to achieve an improper purpose, including influencing

improperly the actions of another party.

[End of ITB]




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

General

Bid Data Sheet

Particulars

Data

Office inviting tender

Chief Engineer (Procurement)
O/o The Engineer in Chief
Water Resources Deptt., Bhopal

NIT No

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-
Cle-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Date of NIT

Bid document download available
from date & time

10:30 hrs.

10:30 hrs.

Website link

https://mptenders.gov.in

For Section 1 - NIT

Clause Particulars Data
reference

2 Portal fees As mentioned online.

3 Cost of bid document Rs. 2000.00
Cost of bid document Payable Payable on line only
at
Cost of bid document In favor | Payable on line only
of
Affidavit format Annexure B

5 Pre-qualifications required NO
If Yes, details Not Applicable

6 Special Eligibility As mentioned in Additional Special Conditions.
If Yes, details As Above

7 Key dates Annexure A

For Section 2 - ITB

1 Name of ‘work’

Hiring of 06 highly skilled
workers (drivers) in the financial
year 2026-27 for operation of
government machinery under
E/M Heavy Machinery Division,
Sagar.

2 | Specifications

Annexure — E

3 Procedure for participation in e-tendering

Annexure — F

Whether J.V. is allowed No
4

If J.V. is allowed, requirement for Joint Venture Annexure — G
9 Pre bid meeting to be held NO




N.I.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

If Yes,

D - —
Time from:  ———————--

Place: = -

Envelope-A containing :

i. Registration number or proof of application for
registration and organizational details

ii. Cost of Bid Document

Annexure - H

at Office of the E-in-C. Water
Resources Department, Tulsi
Nagar Bhopal or Executive

12 | iii. EMD Engineer, E.M H.M. Division
iv. An affidavit duly notarized Sagar r o !
should reach in physical form g
Before 17:30 hrs.
14 | Envelope-B Technical Proposal Annexure | (I-1 to I-5)
15 | Envelope-C Financial Bid Annexure )
Materials to be issued by the department Annexure K
16 | Period of Validity of Bid 180 Days
Earnest Money Deposit Rs. 30000 / -
Forms of Earnest Money Deposit i. FDR/ e-FDR
ii. Demand draft of scheduled
commercial bank
17 iii. Interest bearing securities of
post office.
EMD valid for a period of 180 Days
FDR must be drawn in favour of Executive Engineer, E/M H.M.
Division, W.R. Deptt. Sagar
21 | Letter of Acceptance (LOA) Annexure L
22 | Amount of Performance Security 5% of contract amount

Additional Performance Security, if any

If Applicable

Performance security in the format

Annexure M

Performance security in favor of

Executive Engineer, E/M H.M.
Division, W.R. Deptt. sagar

Performance security valid up to

Valid Contract period plus 12
months




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

N.L.T. No. 628 /2715001/EDP/2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/

Annexure — A

(See clause 1, 7 of Section 1 -NIT)

// CRITICAL/KEY DATES //

Bhopal, Dated 08-04-2026

Seq WRD Stage Bidder Stage btaltt‘_l)a te & Exp:_r;_- Date & Envelopes
No I'ime Iime
1 Pubishing Date | = 30-04-2026 Envelope A,
10:30 Hrs. - Envelope C,
2 : ny
. Jotumo 30-04-2026 | 15-05-2026 G
Download/Sale : 0y .
Start Date 10:30 Hrs. 17:30 Hrs. Envelope C,
3 - glllilile.:b@issi(;nl 08-05-2026 15-05-2026 Envelope A/Fee,
Star r Date
o 10:30 Hirs. 17:30 Hs. Envelope C/
Finance
4 Bid Opening - 18-05-2026 2 Envelope A/Fee
Date
10:30 Hrs.

* While releasing tender please ensure that the duration between purchase start date and Bid
submission end date should not be less than 15 days.

As per order by Chief Engineer (Procurement)

Note :-
1.The date and time for opening Envelope B and C will be declared online after evaluation of the
documents of Envelope A/B (as the case may be).
2.The Critical Date mentioned online shall be considered as the final dates.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — B
(See clause 3 of Section 1 -NIT)

| | AFFIDAVIT | |

(On Non Judicial Stamp of Rs. 200)

I/we who is/ are

(status in the firm/ company) and competent for submission of

the affidavit on behalf of M/S (contractor) do solemnly affirm an
oath and state that:

I/we am/are fully satisfied for the correctness of the certificates/records submitted
in support of the following information in bid documents which are being submitted in
response to notice inviting e-tender No. for

(name of work) dated issued by the

(name of the department).

I/we am/ are fully responsible for the correctness of following self-certified
information/ documents and certificates:

1. That the self-certified information given in the bid document is fully true and
authentic.
2. That:

a. Term deposit receipt deposited as earnest money, demand draft for cost of bid
document and other relevant documents provided by the Bank are authentic.
b. Information regarding financial qualification and annual turnover is correct.
c. Information regarding various technical qualifications is correct.
3. No close relative of the undersigned and our firm/company is working in the
department.
OR
Following close relatives are working in the department:
Name Post Present Posting

Signature with Seal of the Deponent (bidder)

I/ We, above deponent do hereby certify that the facts

mentioned in above paras 1 to 4 are correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.
Verified today (dated) at (place).

Sighature with Seal of the Deponent (bidder)

Note: Affidavit duly notarized in original shall reach at least one calendar day before

opening of the bid.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — C
(See clause 5 of Section 1 -NIT)

PRE-QUALIFICATIONS CRITERIA

The bidder should have:

A. Financial

B. Physical

experience of having successfully executed:

a) three similar works, each costing not less than the amount equal to 20% of
the probable amount of contract during the last 3 financial years; or

b) two similar works, each costing not less than the amount equal to 30% of the
probable amount of contract during the last 3 financial years; or

c) one similar work of aggregate cost not less than the amount equal to 50% of
the probable amount of contract in any one financial year during the last 3

financial years;

Average annual construction turnover on the construction works not less than

50% of the probable amount of contract during the last 3 financial years.

Executed similar items of work in any one financial year during the last 3 financial
years, which should not be less than the minimum, physical requirement, if any,

fixed for the work.

Bid Capacity — Bidder shall be allotted work up to his available Bid Capacity,

which shall be worked out as given in format I-2 of Annexure |.

Physical qualifications for the work shall be as below

Sno Particulars Quantity Period
1 Physical qualification required No
2 | Earthwork
3 | Concrete work

(The Employer shall specify all physical qualifications required).

Note: Above criteria are indicative, subject to suitable stipulations by the
departments and specific Bid.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — D
(See clause 6 of Section 1 -NIT)

SPECIAL ELIGIBILITY CRITERIA

The bidder should have experience of:

A. Erection of Steel Gates S

B. Construction of tunnel S

Note: Above criteria are indicative, subject to suitable stipulations by the departments
and specific bid.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

ANNEXURE - E
(See clause 2 of Section 2 -ITB &
Clause 10 of GCC)
Specifications
) L 1 Department Specifications,
7
3.

The provisions of general / special conditions of contract, those specified elsewhere in the bid
document, as well as execution drawings and notes, or other specifications issued in writing
by the Employer shall form part of the technical specifications of this work.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure—F
(See clause 3 of Section 2 -ITB)

Procedure for participation in e-tendering

Registration of bidders on e-tendering System:

All the bidders registered in MP PWD are also to be registered on the e-tendering

System, website https://www.mpeproc.gov.in, for which no profile creation fees will

be charged. The PWD contractor Id will be used as the e procurement user ID and
password is mailed on the e-mail id registered with MP Online. For resetting of
Password and for more details bidders may contact the Service Providers M/s.TCS &
ANTERES through their helpdesk.

Help Desk:

Eproc helpdesk@mpsedc.gov.in

18002748484, 18002745454
08965065346, 08965022417
0755 - 6500102

Digital Certificate:

The bids submitted online should be signed electronically with a Class Il Digital
Certificate to establish the identity of the bidder submitting the bid online. The
bidders may obtain Class Il Digital Certificate issued by any licensed Certifying
Authority (CAs) authorized by the Controller of Certifying Authorities, Government of
India. A Class Il Digital Certificate is issued upon receipt of mandatory identity proofs
along with an application. Only upon the receipt of the required documents, a Digital

Certificate can be issued.
Note:

i It may take upto 7 working days for issuance of Class Ill Digital Certificate;

hence the bidders are advised to obtain the certificate at the earliest. Those
bidders who already have valid Class Il Digital Certificate need not to obtain
another Digital Certificate for the same.
The bidders may obtain more information and the Application Form required to
be submitted for the issuance of Digital Certificate from the website
Www.cca.gov.in.

jii.  Bids can be submitted during the ONLINE BID SUBMISSION stage only using the

Digital Certificate that is used to encrypt the data and sign the hash during the
ONLINE BID PREPARATION AND BID SUBMISSION stage. In case, during the

process of a particular bid, the bidder looses his Digital Certificate because of




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
any problem (such as misplacement, virus attack, hardware problem, operating

system problem, etc.); he may not be able to submit his bid online. Hence, the
bidders are advised to keep their Digital Certificate in a safe place under proper

security to be used whenever required.

The digital certificate issued to the Authorized User of a Partnership firm / Private
Limited Company / Public Limited Company and used for online biding will be
considered as equivalent to a no-objection certificate / power of attorney to that

user.

In case of Partnership firm, majority of the partners have to authorize a specific

individual through Authority Letter signed by majority of the partners of the firm.

In case of Private Limited Company, Public Limited Company, the Managing Director
has to authorize a specific individual through Authority Letter. Unless the certificate
is revoked, it will be assumed to represent adequate authority of the specific
individual to bid on behalf of the organization for online bids as per Information
Technology Act 2000. This Authorized User will be required to obtain a Digital
Certificate. The Digital Signature executed through the use of Digital Certificate of
this Authorized User will be binding on the firm. It shall be the responsibility of
Management / Partners of the concerned firm to inform the Certifying Authority, if
the Authorized User changes, and apply for a fresh Digital Certificate for the new

Authorized User.

Digital Signature Browser settings are available on the e procurement website use

the link- https://www.mpeproc.gov.in/ROOTAPP

Set Up of Bidder's Computer System:

In order for a bidder to operate on the e-tendering System, the Computer System of
the bidder is required to be set up for Operating System, Internet Connectivity,
Utilities, Fonts, etc. To verify the Browser settings wuse the link-

https://www.mpeproc.gov.in/ROOTAPP/faildpage.jsp

Key Dates:

The bidders are strictly advised to follow the time schedule (Key Dates) of the bid on
their side for tasks and responsibilities to participate in the bid, as all the stages of
each bid are locked before the start time and date and after the end time and date

for the relevant stage of the bid as set by the Department.

PREPARATION AND SUBMISSION OF BIDS:




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
The bidders have to prepare their bids online, encrypt their Bid Data in the Bid Forms

and submit Bid and documents related to the Bid required to be uploaded (of all the
envelopes) as per the time schedule mentioned in the key dates of the Notice
Inviting e-Tenders after signing of the same by the Digital Signature of their

authorized representative.
Purchase of Bid Document

The Bid Document is available free of cost for study and the interested/participating
bidders shall purchase the Document online (through the e- payment gateway). For
purchasing of the bid document bidders have to pay Service Charge online ONLY
which is Rs. [as per Bid Data Sheet]. Cost of bid document is separately mentioned in
the Detailed NIT. The Bid Document shall be available for purchase to concerned
eligible bidders immediately after online release of the bids and up to scheduled

time and date as set in the key dates.

The payment for the cost of bid document shall be made online [as per Bid Data

Sheet] in favour of [as per Bid Data Sheet].

e-payment manual is available on the procurement  website-

https://www.mpeproc.gov.in

The Bidder shall submit the following in three separate envelopes online:

a. Copy of Registration, Earnest Money Deposit

and Affidavit Envelope 'A’
b. Technical Proposal Envelope 'B'
c. Financial Bid Envelope 'C'

Note: Bidders are required to submit the Original Term Deposit Receipt of Earnest
Money Deposit, Copy of Registration and Affidavit in Envelope - ‘A’ physically. The
envelope should be sealed and shall bear the NIT No., System Tender No., name of
work, address of the Employer and name and address of the bidder. The envelope
should reach at the Employer's address at least one calendar day before the start
time and date fixed for opening of technical proposal or as mentioned in the Key
Dates. Scanned copies of the same are to be uploaded online. In the Technical
Proposal the bidders are required to submit the documents described therein. The
Financial Bids are also to be submitted online only and shall not be considered by any

other mode.
WITHDRAWAL, SUBSTITUTION AND MODIFICATION OF BIDS

Bidder can withdraw, substitute or modify the bid after online submission of the bid
but within the stipulated time frame of submission, as per the key dates in Bid

Document.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure -G
(See clause 4 of Section 2 -ITB)

JOINT VENTURE (J.V.)

If J.V. is allowed following conditions and requirements must be fulfilled —

1. Bids submitted by a joint venture of two or more firms as partners shall comply with
the following requirements :

a. one of the partners shall be nominated as being Lead Partner, and this
authorization shall be evidenced by submitting a power of attorney signed by
legally authorized signatories of all the partners;

b. the bid and, in case of a successful bid, the Agreement, shall be signed so as
to be legally binding on all partners;

c. the partner in charge shall be authorized to incur liabilities and receive
instructions for and on behalf of any and all partners of the joint venture and
the entire execution of the contract, including payment, shall be done
exclusively with the partner in charge;

d. all partners of the joint venture shall be liable jointly and severally for the
execution of the contract in accordance with the contract terms, and a
statement to this effect shall be included in the authorization mentioned
under [c] above, as well as in the bid and in the Agreement [in case of a
successful bid];

e. The joint venture agreement should indicate precisely the role of all
members of JV in respect of planning, design, construction equipment, key
personnel, work execution, and financing of the project. All members of JV
should have active participation in execution during the currency of the
contract. This should not be varied/modified subsequently without prior
approval of the employer;

f. The joint venture agreement should be registered, so as to be legally valid
and binding on all partners; and

g. a copy of the Joint Venture Agreement entered into by the partners shall be
submitted with the bid.

2. The figures for each of the partners of a joint venture shall be added together to
determine the Bidder’s compliance with the minimum qualifying criteria required for
the bid. All the partners collectively must meet the criteria specified in full. Failure
to comply with this requirement will result in rejection of the joint venture’s bid.

3. The performance security of a Joint Venture shall be in the name of the partner
Lead Partner/joint venture.

4. Attach the power of attorney of the partners authorizing the Bid signatory(ies) on
behalf of the joint venture

5. Attach the agreement among all partners of the joint venture [and which is legally
binding on all partners], which shows the requirements as indicated in the
Instructions to Bidders’.

6. Furnish details of participation proposed in the joint venture as below:

DETAILS OF PARTICIPATION IN THE JOINT VENTURE

PARTICIPATION DETAILS FIRM ‘A’ (Lead Partner) FIRM ‘B’ FIRM ‘T’

Financial

Name of the Banker(s)

Planning

Construction Equipment

Key Personnel

Execution of Work
(Give details on contribution of each)




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Format: H

(See clause 12 of Section 2 —-ITB
& clause 4 of GCC)

ORGANIZATIONAL DETAILS
(To be enclosed with technical proposal)

S. No. Particulars Details

1. Registration number issued by Centralized
Registration System of Govt. of M.P. or
Proof of application for registration.

2. Valid Registration of bidder in appropriate | Registration
No. Date

class through Centralized Registration of
(Scanned copy of Registration to be uploaded)

Govt. of MP

Name of Organization/ Individual

4, Entity of Organization

Individual/ Proprietary Firm/ Partnership
Firm (Registered under Partnership Act)/
Limited Company (Registered under the
Companies Act—1956)/ Corporation/ Joint
Venture

Address of Communication

Telephone Number with STD Code

Fax Number with STD Code

Mobile Number

Ol o N

E-mail Address for all communications

Details of Authorized Representative

10. Name

11. Designation

12. Postal Address

13. | Telephone Number with STD Code

14. Fax Number with STD Code

15. Mobile Number

16. E-mail Address

Note: In case of partnership firm and limited company certified copy of partnership deed/
Articles of Association and Memorandum of Association alongwith registration
certificate of the company shall have to be enclosed.

Signature of Bidder with Seal
Date:




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — |
(See clause 14 of Section 2 -ITB)

Envelope — B, Technical Proposal

Technical Proposal shall comprise the following documents:

Sno Particulars Details to be submitted
Experience — Financial & Physical Format: I-1
Annual Turnover Format: I-2

List of technical personnel for the key | Format: I-3

positions

4 | List of Key equipments/ machines for | Format: I-4
quality control labs

5 | List of Key equipments/ machines for | Format: I-5
construction work

Note:
1. Technical Proposal should be uploaded duly page numbered and indexed.

2. Technical Proposal uploaded otherwise will not be considered.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

A.

a)

Financial Requirement:

Format: I-1

(See clause 14 of Section 2 -ITB)

FINANCIAL & PHYSICAL EXPERIENCE DETAILS

The bidder should have completed either of the below:
three similar works each costing not less than the amount equal to 20% of

the probable amount of contract during the last 3 financial years; or

two similar works each costing not less than the amount equal to 30% of the

probable amount of contract during the last 3 financial years; or

one similar work of aggregate cost not less than the amount equal to 50% of

the probable amount of contract in any one financial year during the last 3

financial years;

To be filled in by the contractor:
i.  Details of successfully completed similar works shall be furnished in the following

format.
jii. Certificate duly signed by the employer shall also be enclosed for each completed
similar work.
Agreement Name of Date of Date of Amount of Employer's
Number & Year Work Work Order Completion Contract Name and
Address
Existing commitments — (Value of ‘C’ for Bid Capacity formula)
Agreement Name of Date of Date of Amount of Amount of Employer's
Number & Year Work Work Order Completion Contract balance work Name and
Address
B. Physical Requirement:

Execution of similar items of work in any one financial year during the last 3 financial
years should not be less than the minimum physical requirement fixed for the work.

SNo Particulars Actual Quantity Executed
(To be filled in by the contractor)
Year-1 Year -2 Year-3
1 Physical qualification required No
2 Earthwork
3 Concrete work

Note: 1. Certificate duly signed by the employer shall be enclosed for the actual quantity

executed in any one year during the last 3 financial years.

2. Similar works: The similarity shall be based on the physical size, complexity,
methods technology or other characteristics of main items of work viz. earth work,
cement concrete, Reinforced cement concrete, brick masonry, stone masonry etc.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Format: |-2
(See clause 14 of Section 2 -ITB)

ANNUAL TURN OVER

Requirement:

Average annual construction turnover on the construction works not less than 50% of the
probable amount of contract during the last 5 financial years;

To be filled in by the contractor:

Financial Year Payments received for contracts in progress or completed

Note:

i. Annual turnover of construction should be certified by the Chartered Accountant.

ii. Audited balance sheet including all related notes, and income statements for the above
financial years to be enclosed.

Bid Capacity
Applicants who meet the minimum qualifying criteria in the evaluation as stated
above are to be evaluated further for bid capacity as under:
Bid Capacity = (1.5AXB)-C
Where
A = Maximum value of civil engineering works executed in any one year during
the last five year (10% weightage per year shall be given to bring the value
of work executed at present price level)
B = Proposed contract period in years.

C= Amount of work in hand at present.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Format: |-3
(See clause 14 of Section 2 —-ITB &

List Of Technical Personnel For The Key Positions

Clause 6 of GCC)

Requirement of Technical Personnels for Key Positions

Technical Personnels for Key Positions Available with bidder

z v

Key
Position

Minimum
requirement

Qualificati
on

Age

Similar
work
experience

Total Work
Experience

z v

Name of
Personnel

Key
Position

Qualification

Age

Similar Total Work
work Experience
experience




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Format: |1-4
(See clause 14 of Section 2 -ITB)

List Of Key Equipments/ Machines For Quality Control Labs

Minimum requirement Available with the bidder

S. No.

Name of Equipment/ Quantity Name of Equipment/ Quantity
Machinery Machinery




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Format: |-5
(See clause 14 of Section 2 -ITB)

List Of Key Equipments/ Machines For Construction Work

Minimum requirement

Available with the bidder

S. No.

Name of Equipment/
Machinery

Quantity

Name of Equipment/
Machinery

Quantity




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure —J
(See clause 14 of Section 2 -ITB)

FINANCIAL BID
NAME OF WORK

I/We hereby bid for the execution of the above work within the time specified at the

rate (in figures) (in words) percent below/ above or

at par based on the Bill of Quantities and item wise rates given therein in all respects and in
accordance with the specifications, designs, drawings and instructions in writing in all
respects in accordance with such conditions so far as applicable. I/We have visited the site
of work and am/ are fully aware of all the difficulties and conditions likely to affect carrying
out the work. I/We have fully acquainted myself/ourselves about the conditions in regard to
accessibility of site and quarries/kilns, nature and the extent of ground, working conditions
including stacking of materials, installation of tools and plant conditions effecting
accommodation and movement of labour etc. required for the satisfactory execution of
contract.

Should this bid be accepted, |/We hereby agree to abide by and fulfill all the terms
and provisions of the said conditions of contract annexed hereto so far as applicable, or in
default thereof to forfeit and pay to the Governor of Madhya Pradesh or his successors in
office the sums of money mentioned in the said conditions.

Note:

i Only one rate of percentage above or below or at par based on the Bill of Quantities

and item wise rates given therein shall be quoted.

ii. Percentage shall be quoted in figures as well as in words. If any difference in figures
and words is found lower of the two shall be taken as valid and correct rate. If the
bidder is not ready to accept such valid and correct rate and declines to furnish
performance security and sign the agreement his earnest money deposit shall be
forfeited.

jii. In case the percentage "above" or "below" is not given by a bidder, his bid shall be
treated as non-responsive.

iv. All duties, taxes, and other levies payable by the bidder shall be included in the
percentage quoted by the bidder.

Signature of Bidder
Name of Bidder
The above bid is hereby accepted by me on behalf of the Governor of Madhya
Pradesh dated the day of 20

Signature of Officer by whom accepted




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure - K

(See clause 15 of Section 2 -ITB)

MATERIALS TO BE ISSUED BY THE DEPARTMENT

Sno Name of material Rate (Issue rate) Unit Remarks




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — L
(See clause 21 of Section 2 -ITB)

LETTER OF ACCEPTANCE (LOA)
No. Dated:

To,
M/s.

(Name and address of the contractor)

Subject:

(Name of the work as appearing in the bid for the work)

Dear Sir (s),

Your bid for the work mentioned above has been accepted on behalf of the Governor
of Madhya Pradesh at your bided percentage below/ above or at par the Bill of

Quantities and item wise rates given therein.

You are requested to submit within 15 (Fifteen) days from the date of issue of this

letter:

a. the performance security/ performance guarantee of Rs. (in figures)

(Rupees in words only).

The performance security shall be in the shape of term deposit receipt/ bank
guarantee of any nationalized / schedule commercial bank valid up to three
months after the expiry of defects liability period.

b. Sign the contract agreement.

Please note that the time allowed for carrying out the work as entered in the bid is
months including/ excluding rainy season, shall be reckoned from the date of

signing the contract agreement.

Signing the contract agreement shall be reckoned as intimation to commencement of
work and no separate letter for commencement of work is required. Therefore, after signing
of the agreement, you are directed to contact the Engineer-in-charge for taking the

possession of site and necessary instructions to start the work.

Yours Faithfully

Executive Engineer




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure - M
(See clause 22 of Section 2 -ITB)

PERFORMANCE SECURITY
To

[name of Employer]

[address of Employer]

WHEREAS [name and address of Contractor]
(hereinafter called "the Contractor") has undertaken, in pursuance of Letter of Acceptance

No. dated to execute [name of Contract and
brief description of Works] (hereinafter called "the Contract").

AND WHEREAS it has been stipulated by you in the said Contract that the Contractor
shall furnish you with a Bank Guarantee by a recognized bank for the sum specified therein
as security for compliance with his obligation in accordance with the Contract;

AND WHEREAS we have agreed to give the Contractor such a Bank Guarantee:
NOW THEREFORE we hereby affirm that we are the Guarantor and responsible to
you on behalf of the Contractor, up to a total of [amount of guarantee]*
___(in words), such sum being payable in the types and proportions of
currencies in which the Contract Price is payable, and we undertake to pay you, upon your
first written demand and without cavil or argument, any sum or sums within the limits of
[amount of guarantee] as aforesaid without your needing to prove or
to show grounds or reasons for your demand for the sum specified therein.
We hereby waive the necessity of your demanding the said debt from the
contractor before presenting us with the demand.

We further agree that no change or addition to or other modification of the
terms of the Contract of the Works to be performed thereunder or of any of the Contract
documents which may be made between you and the Contractor shall in any way release us
from any liability under this guarantee, and we hereby waive notice of any such change,
addition or modification.

This guarantee shall be valid until 3 (three) months from the date of expiry of
the Defect Liability Period.

Signature and Seal of the guarantor

Name of Bank
Address
Date

* An amount shall be inserted by the Guarantor, representing the percentage the

Contract Price specified in the Contract including additional security for unbalanced Bids, if
any and denominated in Indian Rupees.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

SECTION 3

Conditions of Contract
Part — | General Conditions of Contract

Table of Clauses

Sno Particulars Sno Particulars
A. General 21 | Payments for Variations and / or Extra Quantities
1 Definitions 22 | No compensation for alterations in or restriction
of work to be carried out.
2 Interpretations and Documents 23 | No Interest Payable
3 Language and Law 24 | Recovery from Contractors
4 Communications 25 | Tax
5 | Subcontracting 26 | Check Measurements
6 Personnel 27 | Termination by Engineer in Charge
7 Force Majeure 28 | Payment upon Termination
8 | Contractor's Risks 29 | Performance Security
9 Liability For Accidents To Person 30 | Security Deposit
10 | Contractor to Construct the Works 31 | Price Adjustment
11 | Discoveries 32 | Mobilization and Construction Machinery
Advance
12 | Dispute Resolution System 33 | Secured Advance
B. Time Control 34 | Payments Certificates
13 | Programme E. Finishing the Contract
14 | Extension of Time 35 | Completion Certificate
15 | Compensation for Delay 36 | Final Account
16 | Contractor’s quoted percentage F. Other Conditions of Contract
C. Quality Control 37 | Currencies

17 | Tests 38 | Labour
18 | Correction of Defects noticed 39 | Compliance with Labour Regulations

during the Defect Liability Period

D. Cost Control 40 | Audit and Technical Examination

19 | Variations - Change in original 41 | Death or Permanent Invalidity of Contractor

Specifications, Designs, Drawings

etc.
20 | Extra ltems 42 | Jurisdiction




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
A. General
1. DEFINITIONS

1.1.  Bill of Quantities: means the priced and completed Bill of Quantities forming part of
the Bid.

1.2.  Chief Engineer: means Chief Engineer of the zone/ basin concerned.

1.3. Completion: means completion of the work as certified by the Engineer-in-Charge, in
accordance with provisions of agreement.

1.4. Contract: means the Contract between the Employer and the Contractor to execute,
complete and/or maintain the work. Agreement is synonym of Contract and carries
the same meaning wherever used.

1.5. Contract Data: means the documents and other information which comprise of the
Contract.

1.6.  Contractor: means a person or legal entity whose bid to carry out the work has been
accepted by the Employer.

1.7.  Contractor's bid: means the completed bid document submitted by the Contractor
to the Employer.

1.8. Contract amount: means the amount of contract worked out on the basis of
accepted bid.

1.9. Completion of work: means completion of the entire contracted work. Exhaustion of
qguantity of any particular item mentioned in the bid document shall not imply
completion of work or any component thereof.

1.10. Day: means the calendar day.
1.11. Defect: means any part of the work not completed in accordance with the
specifications included in the contract.

1.12. Department: means Department of the State Government viz. Water Resources
Department, Public Works Department, Public Health Engineering Department, Rural
Engineering Service and any other organisation which adopts this document.

1.13. Drawings: means drawings including calculations and other information provided or
approved by the Engineer-in-Charge.

1.14. Employer: means the party as defined in the Contract Data, who employs the
Contractor to carry out the work. The Employer may delegate any or all functions to
a person or body nominated by him for specified functions. The word Employer /
Government / Department wherever used denote the Employer.

1.15. Engineer: means the person named in the Contract Data.
1.16. Engineer in charge: means the person named in the Contract Data.

1.17. Equipment: means the Contractor's machinery and vehicles brought temporarily to
the Site for execution of work.

1.18. Government: means Government of Madhya Pradesh.

1.19. In Writing: means communicated in written form and delivered against receipt.

1.20. Material: means all supplies, including consumables, used by the Contractor for
incorporation in the work.

1.21. Superintending Engineer: means Superintending Engineer-in-Charge of the Circle
concerned.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

1.22. Stipulated period of completion: means the period in which the Contractor is
required to complete the work. The stipulated period is specified in the Contract
Data.

1.23. Specification: means the specification of the work included in the Contract and any
modification or addition made or approved by the Engineer-in-Charge.

1.24. Start Date: means the date of signing of agreement for the work.

1.25. Sub-Contractor: means a person or corporate body who has a Contract with the
Contractor, duly authorised to carry out a part of the construction work under the
Contract.

1.26. Temporary Work: means work designed, constructed, installed, and removed by the
Contractor that are needed for construction or installation of the work.

1.27. Tender/Bid, Tenderer/Bidder: are the synonyms and carry the same meaning where
ever used.

1.28. Variation: means any change in the work which is instructed or approved as
variation under this contract.

1.29. Work: The expression "work" or "works" where used in these conditions shall unless
there be something either in the subject or context repugnant to such construction,
be construed and taken to mean the work by virtue of contract, contracted to be
executed, whether temporary or permanent and whether original, altered,
substituted or additional.

2. INTERPRETATIONS AND DOCUMENTS

2.1 Interpretations

In the contract, except where the context requires otherwise:
a. words indicating one gender include all genders;
b. words indicating the singular also include the plural and vice versa.

c. provisions including the word “agree”, “agreed” or “agreement” require the
agreement to be recorded in writing;

d. written” or “in writing” means hand-written, type-written, printed or
electronically made, and resulting in a permanent record;

2.2  Documents Forming Part of Contract:

1. NIT with all amendments.

2. Instructions to Bidders

3. Conditions of Contract:

1. Part I General Conditions of Contract and the Contract Data; and
ii. Part II Special Conditions of Contract.

4. Specifications

5. Drawings

6. Bill of Quantities

7. Technical and Financial Bid

8. Agreement, and

9. Any other document(s), as specified.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

3. Language and Law

The language of the Contract and the law governing the Contract are stated in the
Contract Data.

4. Communications

All certificates, notice or instruction to be given to the Contractor by
Employer/Engineer shall be sent to the address or contact details given by the
Contractor in [Annexure H of ITB]. The address and contact details for
communication with the Employer/Engineer shall be as per the details given in the
Contract Data. Communication between parties that are referred to in the conditions
shall be in writing. The notice sent by facsimile (fax) or other electronic means
(email) shall also be effective on confirmation of the transmission. The notice sent by
registered post or speed post shall be effective on delivery or at the expiry of the
normal delivery period as undertaken by the postal service. In case of any change in
address for communication, the same shall be immediately notified to Engineer-in-
Charge.

5. Subcontracting

Subcontracting shall be permitted for contracts of value more than amount specified

in the Contract Data with following conditions.

a. The Contractor may subcontract up to 25 percent of the contract price with the
approval of the Employer in writing, but will not assign the Contract.
Subcontracting shall not alter the Contractor's obligations.

b. Following shall not form part of subcontracting:

i. Hiring of labour through a labour contractor.
ii. The purchase of Materials to be incorporated in the works.
iii. Hiring of plant & machinery

c. The sub-contractor will have to be registered in the appropriate category in the

centralised registration system for contractors of the GoMP.

6. Personnel

6.1

6.2

The Contractor shall employ for the construction work and routine maintenance the
technical personnel as provided in the Annexure I-3 of Bid Data Sheet, if applicable. If
the Contractor fails to deploy required number of technical staff, recovery as
specified in the Contract Data will be made from the Contractor.

If the Engineer asks the Contractor to remove a person who is a member of the
Contractor's staff or work force, stating the reasons, the Contractor shall ensure that
the person leaves the Site within three days and has no further connection with the
Works in the Contract.

7. Force Majeure

7.1

The term “Force Majeure” means an exceptional event or circumstance:
(a) which is beyond a Party’s control,




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

7.2.

7.3

74

(b) which such Party could not reasonably have provided against before entering into
the Contract,

(c) which, having arisen, such Party could not reasonably have avoided or overcome,
and

(d) which is not substantially attributable to the other Party.

Force Majeure may include, but is not limited to, exceptional events or

circumstances of the kind listed below, so long as conditions (a) to (d) above are

satisfied:

(i) war, hostilities (whether war be declared or not), invasion, act of foreign
enemies,

(ii) rebellion, terrorism, sabotage by persons other than the Contractor’s
Personnel, revolution, insurrection, military or usurped power, or civil war,

(i) riot, commotion, disorder, strike or lockout by persons other than the
Contractor’s Personnel,

(iv) munitions of war, explosive materials, ionising radiation or contamination by
radio-activity, except as may be attributable to the Contractor’s use of such
munitions, explosives, radiation or radio-activity, and

(v) natural catastrophes such as earthquake, hurricane, typhoon or volcanic

activity.
In the event of either party being rendered unable by force majeure to perform any
duty or discharge any responsibility arising out of the contract, the relative obligation
of the party affected by such force majeure shall upon notification to the other party
be suspended for the period during which force majeure event lasts. The cost and
loss sustained by either party shall be borne by respective parties.
For the period of extension granted to the Contractor due to Force Majeure the price
adjustment clause shall apply but the penalty clause shall not apply. It is clarified that
this sub clause shall not give eligibility for price adjustment to contracts which are
otherwise not subject to the benefit of price adjustment clause.
The time for performance of the relative obligation suspended by the force majeure
shall stand extended by the period for which such cause lasts. Should the delay
caused by force majeure exceed twelve months, the parties to the contract shall be
at liberty to foreclose the contract after holding mutual discussions.

8. Contractor's Risks

8.1

8.2

All risks of loss or damage to physical property and of personal injury and death
which arise during and in consequence of the performance of the Contract are the
responsibility of the Contractor.

All risks and consequences arising from the inaccuracies or falseness of the
documents, drawing, designs, other documents and/or information submitted by the
contractor shall be the responsibility of the Contractor alone, notwithstanding the
fact that the designs/ drawings or other documents have been approved by the
department.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
9. Liability for Accidents to Person

The contractor shall be deemed to have indemnified and saved harmless the
Government against all action, suits, claims, demands, costs etc. arising in
connection with injuries suffered by any persons employed by the contractor or his
subcontractor for the works whether under the General law or under workman's
compensation Act, or any other statute in force at the time of dealing with the
question of the liability of employees for the injuries suffered by employees and to
have taken steps properly to ensure against any claim there under.

10. Contractor to Construct the Works

10.1 The Contractor shall construct, install and maintain the Works in accordance with
the Specifications and Drawings as specified in the Contract Data.

10.2 In the case of any class of work for which there is no such specification as is
mentioned in Contract Data, such work shall be carried out in accordance with the
instructions and requirement of the Engineer-in-charge.

10.3 The contractor shall supply and take upon himself the entire responsibility of the
sufficiency of the scaffolding, timbering, machinery, tools and implements, and
generally of all means used for the fulfilment of this contract whether such means
may or may not be approved or recommended by the Engineer.

11. Discoveries
Anything of historical or other interest or of significant value unexpectedly
discovered on the Site shall be the property of the Employer. The Contractor shall
notify the Engineer of such discoveries and carry out the Engineer's instructions for
dealing with them.

12. Dispute Resolution System

12.1 No dispute can be raised except before the Competent Authority as defined in
Contract Data in writing giving full description and grounds of dispute. It is clarified
that merely recording protest while accepting measurement and/or payment shall
not be taken as raising a dispute.

12.2 No dispute can be raised after 45 days of its first occurrence. Any dispute raised after
expiry of 45 days of its first occurrence shall not be entertained and the Employer
shall not be liable for claims arising out of such dispute.

12.3 The Competent Authority shall decide the matter within 45 days.

12.4 Appeal against the order of the Competent Authority can be preferred within 30
days to the Appellate Authority as defined in the Contract Data. The Appellate
Authority shall decide the dispute within 45 days.

12.5 Appeal against the order of the Appellate Authority can be preferred before the

Madhya Pradesh Arbitration Tribunal constituted under Madhya Pradesh
Madhyastham Adhikaran Adhiniyam, 1983.

12.6 The Contractor shall have to continue execution of the Works with due diligence
notwithstanding pendency of a dispute before any authority or forum.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
B. Time Control

13. Programme

13.1 W.ithin the time stated in the Contract Data, the Contractor shall submit to the
Engineer for approval a Programme showing the general methods, arrangements,
order and timing for all the activities for the construction of works.

13.2 The program shall be supported with all the details regarding key personnel,
equipment and machinery proposed to be deployed on the works for its execution.
The contractor shall submit the list of equipment and machinery being brought to
site, the list of key personnel being deployed, the list of machinery/equipment being
placed in field laboratory and the location of field laboratory along with the
Programme.

13.3 An update of the Programme shall be a programme showing the actual progress
achieved on each activity and the effect of the progress achieved on the timing of
the remaining Works, including any changes to the sequence of the activities.

13.4 The Contractor shall submit to the Engineer for approval an updated Programme at
intervals no longer than the period stated in the Contract Data. If the Contractor
does not submit an updated Programme within this period, the Engineer may
withhold the amount stated in the Contract Data from the next payment certificate
and continue to withhold this amount until the next payment after the date on
which the overdue Programme has been submitted.

13.5 The Engineer's approval of the Programme shall not alter the Contractor's
obligations.

14. Extension of Time

14.1. |If the Contractor desires an extension of time for completion of the work on the
ground of his having been unavoidably hindered in its execution or on any other
grounds, he shall apply, in writing, to the Engineer-in-charge, on account of which he
desires such extension. Engineer-in-Charge shall forward the aforesaid application
to the Competent Authority as prescribed.

14.2 The competent authority shall grant such extension at each such occasion within a
period of 30 days of receipt of application from contractor and shall not wait for
finality of work. Such extensions shall be granted in accordance with provisions
under clause- 15 of this agreement.

14.3 In case the work is already in progress, the Contractor shall proceed with the
execution of the works, including maintenance thereof, pending receipt of the
decision of the competent authority as aforesaid with all due diligence.

15. Compensation for delay

15.1 The time allowed for carrying out the work, as entered in the agreement, shall be
strictly observed by the Contractor.

15.2 The time allowed for execution of the contract shall commence from the date of
signing of the agreement. It is clarified that the need for issue of work order is
dispensed with.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
15.3 In the event milestones are laid down in the Contract Data for execution of the

works, the contractor shall have to ensure strict adherence to the same.

15.4 Failure of the Contractor to adhere to the timelines and/or milestones shall attract
such liquidated damages as is laid down in the Contract Data.

15.5 Inthe event of delay in execution of the Works as per the timelines mentioned in the
Contract Data the Engineer-in-charge shall retain from the bills of the Contractor
amount equal to the liquidated damages leviable until the Contractor makes such
delays good. However, the Engineer-in-charge shall accept bankable security in lieu
of retaining such amount.

15.6 If the Contractor is given extension of time after liquidated damages have been paid,
the Engineer in Charge shall correct any over payment of liquidated damages by the
Contractor in the next payment certificate.

15.7 In the event the Contractor fails to make good the delay until completion of the
stipulated contract period (including extension of time) the sum so retained shall be
adjusted against the liquidated damages levied.

16. Contractor's quoted percentage
The Contractor’s quoted percentage rate referred to in the "Bid for works" will be
deducted/ added from/to the net amount of the bill after deducting the cost of
material supplied by the department.

C. Quality Control
17. Tests
17.1 The Contractor shall be responsible for:
a. Carrying out the tests prescribed in specifications, and
b. For the correctness of the test results, whether preformed in his laboratory

or elsewhere.
17.2 The contractor shall have to establish field laboratory within the time specified and
having such equipments as are specified in the Contract Data.
17.3 Failure of the Contractor to establish laboratory shall attract such penalty as is
specified in the Contract Data.

18. Correction of Defects noticed during the Defect Liability Period

18.1 The Defect Liability Period of work in the contract shall be as per the Contract Data.

18.2 The Contractor shall promptly rectify all defects pointed out by the Engineer well
before the end of the Defect Liability Period. The Defect Liability Period shall
automatically stand extended until the defect is rectified.

18.3 If the Contractor has not corrected a Defect pertaining to the Defect Liability Period
to the satisfaction of the Engineer, within the time specified by the Engineer, the
Engineer will assess the cost of having the Defect corrected, and the cost of
correction of the Defect shall be recovered from the Performance Security or any
amount due or that may become due to the contractor and other available
securities.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

19.

19.1

19.2

20.
20.1

21
21.1

D. Cost Control

Variations - Change in original Specifications, Designs, and Drawings etc.

The Engineer-in-charge shall have power to make any alterations, omissions or
additions to or substitutions in the original specifications, drawings, designs and
instructions, that may appear to him to be necessary during the progress of the work
and the contractor shall carry out the work in accordance with any instructions
which may be given to him in writing signed by the Engineer-in-charge, and such
alterations, omission, additions or substitutions shall not invalidate the contract and
any altered, additional or substituted work, which the contractor may be directed to
do in the manner above specified, as part of the work, shall be carried out by the
contractor on the same conditions in all respects on which he agrees to do the main
work.

The time for the completion of the work shall be adjusted in the proportion that the
altered, additional or substituted work bears to the original contract work and the
certificate of the Engineer-in-charge shall be conclusive as to such proportion.

Extra items
All such items which are not included in the priced BOQ shall be treated as extra
items.

Payments for Variations and / or Extra Quantities

The rates for such additional (Extra quantity), altered or substituted work / extra
items under this clause shall be worked out in accordance with the following
provisions in their respective order:-

a. The contractor is bound to carry out the additional (Extra quantity), work at the
same rates as are specified in the contract for the work.

b. If the item is not in the priced BOQ and is included in the SOR of the department,
the rate shall be arrived at by applying the quoted tender percentage on the SOR
rate.

c. If the rates for the altered or substituted work are not provided in applicable
SOR - such rates will be derived from the rates for a similar class (type) of work as
is provided in the contract (priced BOQ) for the work.

d. If the rates for the altered, substituted work cannot be determined in the
manner specified in the sub clause (c) above - then the rates for such composite
work item shall be worked out on the basis of the concerned Schedule of Rates
minus/plus the percentage quoted by the contractor.




22.
22.

22.

22.

23.

24.

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
e. If the rates for a particular part or parts of the item is not in the Schedule of

Rates and the rates for the altered, or substituted work item cannot be
determined in the manner specified in sub clause (b) to (d) above, the rate for
such part or parts will be determined by the Competent Authority as defined in
the Contract Data on the basis of the rate analysis derived out of prevailing
market rates when the work was done.

f.  But under no circumstances, the contractor shall suspend the work on the plea of
non-acceptability of rates on items falling under sub clause (a) to (d). In case the
contractor does not accept the rate approved by the Engineer in Charge for a
particular item, the contractor shall continue to carry out the item at the rates
determined by the Competent Authority. The decision on the final rates payable
shall be arrived at through the dispute settlement procedure.

No compensation for alterations in or restriction of work to be carried out.

1 If at any time after the commencement of the work, the Engineer-in-charge, for any
reason whatsoever, not require the whole or any part of the work as specified in the
bid to be carried out; the Engineer-in-charge shall give notice in writing of the fact to
the Contractor and withdraw that whole or any part of the work.

2 The Contractor shall have no claim to any payments or compensation whatsoever,
on account of any profit or advantage which he might have derived from the
execution of work in full or on account of any loss incurred for idle men and
machinery due to any alteration or restriction of work for whatsoever reason.

3 The Engineer-in-charge may supplement the work by engaging another agency to
execute such portion of the work, without prejudice to his rights.

No Interest Payable
No interest shall be payable to the Contractor on any payment due or awarded by
any authority.

Recovery from Contractors

Whenever any claim against the Contractor for the payment arises under the

contract, the Department may be entitled to recover such sum by:

(a) Appropriating, in part or whole of the Performance Guarantee and/or Security
Deposit and / or any sums payable under the contract to the contractor.

(b) If the amount recovered in accordance with (a) above is not sufficient, the
balance sum may be recovered from any payment due to the contractor under
any other contract of the department, including the securities which become due
for release.

(c) The department shall, further have an additional right to effect recoveries as
arrears of land revenue under the M.P. Land Revenue Code.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
25. Tax

25.1 The rates quoted by the Contractor shall be deemed to be inclusive of the commercial
tax and other levies, duties, cess, toll, taxes of Central and State Governments, local
bodies and authorities..

25.2 The liability, if any, on account of quarry fees, royalties, octroi and any other taxes
and duties in respect of materials actually consumed on public work, shall be borne by
the Contractor.

25.3 Any changes in the taxes except GST due to change in legislation or for any other reason
shall not be payable to the contractor.

25.4 If during the implementation of the contract, the rate of GST on works contract service is
reduced from 18%, then the difference of GST on work contracts service rates will be
recovered from the date on which the reduction in GST rates shall be effective. Similarly,
if GST rates increase from 18%, then the difference of GST on works contract service
rates will be paid additionally as per actual from the date on which the increase in GST
rates shall be effective..

26. Check Measurements

26.1 The department reserves to itself the right to prescribe a scale of check
measurement of work in general or specific scale for specific works or by other
special orders.

26.2 Checking of measurement by superior officer shall supersede measurements by
subordinate officer(s), and the former will become the basis of the payment.

26.3 Any over/excess payments detected, as a result of such check measurement or
otherwise at any stage up to the date of completion of the defect liability period
specified in this contract, shall be recoverable from the Contractor, as per clause 24
above.

27. Termination by Engineer in Charge

27.1 If the Contractor fails to carry out any obligation under the Contract, the Engineer in
Charge may by notice require the Contractor to make good the failure and to remedy
it within a specified reasonable time.

27.2 The Engineer in Charge shall be entitled to terminate the Contract if the Contractor

a) abandons the Works or otherwise plainly demonstrates the intention not to
continue performance of his obligations under the Contract,

b) the Contractor is declared as bankrupt or goes into liquidation other than for
approved reconstruction or amalgamation;

c) without reasonable excuse fails to comply with the notice to correct a particular
defect within a reasonable period of time.

d) the Contractor does not maintain a valid instrument of financial security as
prescribed;

e) the Contractor has delayed the completion of the Works by such duration for
which the maximum amount of liquidated damages is recoverable;

f) If the Contractor fails to deploy machinery and equipment or personnel or set up
a field laboratory as specified in the Contract Data.

g) If the contractor, in the judgment of the Engineer in charge has engaged in
corrupt or fraudulent practices in competing for or in executing the contract.

h) Any other fundamental breaches as specified in the Contract Data.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
27.3 In any of these events or circumstances, the Engineer in Charge may, upon giving 14
days’ notice to the Contractor, terminate the Contract and expel the Contractor from
the Site. However, in the case of sub-paragraph (b) or (g) of clause 27.2, the Engineer
in Charge may terminate the Contract immediately.
27.4 Notwithstanding the above, the Engineer-in-Charge may terminate the Contract for

convenience by giving notice to the Contractor.

28. Payment upon Termination

28.1 If the contract is terminated under clause 27. 3, the Engineer shall issue a certificate
for value of the work accepted on final measurements, less advance payments and
penalty as indicated in the Contract Data. The amount so arrived at shall be
determined by the Engineer-in-Charge and shall be final and binding on both the
parties.

28.2 Payment on termination under clause 27. 4 above -
If the Contract is terminated under clause 27.4 above, the Engineer shall issue a
certificate for the value of the work done, the reasonable cost of removal of
Equipment, repatriation of the Contractor's personnel employed solely on the
Works, and the Contractor's costs of protecting and securing the Works and less
advance payments received up to the date of the certificate, less other recoveries
due in terms of the contract and less taxes due to be deducted at source as per
applicable law.

28.3 If the total amount due to the Employer exceeds any payment due to the Contractor,
the difference shall be recovered as per clause 24 above.

29. Performance Security
The Contractor shall have to submit performance security as specified in the Bid Data
Sheet at the time of signing of the contract. The contractor shall have to ensure that
such performance security remains valid for the period as specified in the Contract
Data.

30. Security Deposit-

30.1 Security Deposit shall be deducted from each running bill at the rate as specified in
the Contract Data. The total amount of Security Deposit so deducted shall not
exceed the percentage of Contract Price specified in the Contract Data.

30.2 The security deposit may be replaced by equivalent amount of bank guarantee or
fixed deposit receipt assigned to the Employer, with validity up to 3 (three) months
beyond the completion of Defect Liability Period/ extended Defect Liability Period.

30.3 The Security Deposit shall be refunded on completion of Defect Liability Period.

31. Price Adjustment
31.1 Applicability

1. Price adjustment shall be applicable only if provided for in the Contract Data.
2. The price adjustment clause shall apply only for the works executed from the
date of signing of the agreement until the end of the initial intended completion




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
date or extensions granted for reasons attributed to the Employer by the

Engineer.

3. The Contractor shall not be entitled to any benefit arising from the price
adjustment clause for extension in the contract period for reasons attributed to
the Contractor.

4. Inthe Force Majeure event the price escalation clause shall apply.

31.2 Procedure

1. Contract price shall be adjusted for increase or decrease in rates and price of
labour, materials, fuels and lubricants in accordance with following principles and
procedures and as per formula given in the contract data.

2. The price adjustable shall be determined during each quarter from the formula
given in the contract data.

3. Following expression and meaning are assigned to the work done during each
quarter:
R = Total value of work during the quarter. It would include the amount of secured
advance granted, if any, during the quarter, less the amount of secured advance
recovered, if any during the quarter, less value of material issued by the department, if
any, during the quarter.

4. Weightages of various components of the work shall be as per the Contract Data.

31.3 To the extent that full compensation for any rise or fall in costs to the contractor is
not covered by the provisions of this or other clauses in the contract, the unit rates
and prices included in the contract shall be deemed to include amounts to cover the
contingency of such other rise or fall in costs.

31.4 The index relevant to any quarter, for which such compensation is paid, shall be the
arithmetical average of the indices relevant of the calendar month.

31.5 For the purpose of clarity it is pointed out that the price adjustment may be either
positive or negative, i.e. if the price adjustment is in favour of the Employer, the
same shall be recovered from the sums payable to the Contractor.

32. Mobilization and Construction Machinery Advance

32.1 Payment of advances shall be applicable if provided in the Contract Data.

32.2 If applicable, the Engineer in Charge shall make interest bearing advance payment to
the contractor of the amounts stated in the Contract Data, against provision by the
contractor of an unconditional Bank Guarantee in a form and by a nationalized/
scheduled banks, in the name as stated in the Contract Data, in amounts equal to
the advance payment. The guarantee shall remain effective until the advance
payment has been repaid, but the amount of the guarantee shall be progressively
reduced by the amounts repaid by the contractor.

32.3 The rate of interest chargeable shall be as per Contract Data.

32.4 The construction machinery advance, if applicable, shall be limited to 80% of the cost
of construction machinery and admissible only for new construction machinery.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
32.5 The advance payment shall be recovered as stated in the Contract Data by deducting

proportionate amounts from payment otherwise due to the Contractor. No account
shall be taken of the advance payment or its recovery in assessing valuations of work
done, variations, price adjustments, compensation events, or liquidated damages.

33. Secured Advance

33.1 Payment of Secured Advance shall be applicable if provided in the Contract Data.

33.2 If applicable, the Engineer shall make advance payment against materials intended
for but not yet incorporated in the Works and against provision by the contractor of
an unconditional Bank Guarantee in a form and by a nationalized/ scheduled bank, in
the name as stated in the Contract Data, in amounts equal to the advance payment.
The guarantee shall remain effective until the advance payment has been adjusted,
but the amount of the guarantee shall be progressively reduced by the amounts
adjusted by the contractor.

33.3 The amount of secured advance and conditions to be fulfilled shall be as stipulated in
the Contract Data.

33.4 The Secured Advance paid shall be recovered as stated in the Contract Data.

34. Payment Certificates
The payment to the contractor will be as follows for construction work:
(a) The Contractor shall submit to the Engineer monthly statements of the value of
the work executed less the cumulative amount certified previously, supported
with detailed measurement of the items of work executed.

(b) The Engineer shall check the Contractor’s monthly statement and certify the
amount to be paid to the Contractor.

(c) The value of work executed shall be determined, based on the measurements
approved by the Engineer/ Engineer-in-charge.

(d) The value of work executed shall comprise the value of the quantities of the
items in the Bill of Quantities completed.

(e) The value of work executed shall also include the valuation of Variations and
Compensation Events.

(f) All payments shall be adjusted for deductions for advance payment, security
deposit, other recoveries in terms of contract and taxes at source as applicable
under the law.

(g) The Engineer may exclude any item certified in a previous certificate or reduce
the proportion of any item previously certified in any certificate in the light of
later information.

(h) Payment of intermediate certificate shall be regarded as payments by way of
advance against the final payment and not as payments for work actually done
and completed.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

35.

35.1

35.2

36.
36.1

36.2

37.

38.
38.1

38.2

(i) Intermediate payment shall not preclude the requiring of bad, unsound and
imperfect or unskilled work to be removed and taken away and reconstructed or
be considered as an admission of the due performance of the contractor any part
thereof, in any respect or the occurring of any claim.

(j) The payment of final bill shall be governed by the provisions of clause 36 of GCC.

E. Finishing the Contract

Completion Certificate

A Completion Certificate in the prescribed format in Contract Data shall be issued by
the Engineer-in-Charge after physical completion of the Work.

After final payment to the Contractor, a Final Completion Certificate in the
prescribed format in the Contract Data shall be issued by the Engineer-in-Charge.

Final Account

The Contractor shall supply the Engineer with a detailed account of the total amount
that the Contractor considers payable for works under the Contract within 21 days of
issue of certificate of physical completion of works. The Engineer shall issue a
Defects Liability Certificate and certify any payment that is due to the Contractor
within 45 days of receiving the Contractor’s account if it is correct and complete. If
the account is not correct or complete, the Engineer shall issue within 45 days a
schedule that states the scope of the corrections or additions that are necessary. If
the Account is still unsatisfactory after it has been resubmitted, the matter shall be
referred to the Competent Authority as defined in the Contract Data, who shall
decide on the amount payable to the Contractor after hearing the Contractor and
the Engineer in Charge.

In case the account is not received within 21 days of issue of Certificate of
Completion as provided in clause 32.1 above, the Engineer shall proceed to finalise
the account and issue a payment certificate within 28 days.

F. Other Conditions of Contract
Currencies
All payments will be made in Indian Rupees.

Labour

The Contractor shall, unless otherwise provided in the Contract, make his own
arrangements for the engagement of all staff and labour, local or other, and for their
payment, housing, feeding and transport.

The Contractor shall, if required by the Engineer, deliver to the Engineer a return in
detail, in such form and at such intervals as the Engineer may prescribe, showing the
staff and the numbers of the several classes of labour from time to time employed




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
by the Contractor on the Site and such other information as the Engineer may

require.

39. COMPLIANCE WITH LABOUR REGULATIONS

39.1. During continuance of the Contract, the Contractor and his sub-Contractors shall
abide at all times by all existing labour enactments and rules made there under,
regulations, notifications and bye laws of the State or Central Government or local
authority and any other labour law (including rules), regulations, bye laws that may
be passed or notification that may be issued under any labour law in future either by
the State or the Central Government or the local authority. Salient features of some
of the major labour laws that are applicable to construction industry are given in the
Contract Data. The Contractor shall keep the Employer indemnified in case any
action is taken against the Employer by the competent authority on account of
contravention of any of the provisions of any Act or rules made their under,
regulations or notifications including amendments. If the Employer is caused to pay
or reimburse, such amounts as may be necessary to cause or observe, or for non-
observance of the provisions stipulated in the notifications/byelaws/Acts/Rules/
regulations including amendments, if any, on the part of the Contractor, the
Engineer/Employer shall have the right to deduct from any money due to the
Contractor including his amount of performance security. The Employer/Engineer
shall also have right to recover from the Contractor any sum required or estimated
to be required for making good the loss or damage suffered by the Employer. The
employees of the Contractor and the Sub-Contractor in no case shall be treated as
the employees of the Employer at any point of time.

40. Audit and Technical Examination

Government shall have the right to cause an audit and technical examination of the
works and the final bill of the contract including all supporting vouchers, abstract etc.
to be made after payment of the final bill and if as a result of such audit and
technical examination any sum is found to have been overpaid in respect of any
work done by the contractor under the contract or any work claimed by him to have
been done under the contract and found not to, have been executed, the Contractor
shall be liable to refund the amount of overpayment and it shall be lawful for
Government to recover the same from him in the manner prescribed in clause 24
above and if it is found that the Contractor was paid less than what was due to him,
under the contract in respect of any work executed by him under it, the amount of
such under payment shall be duly paid by Government to the Contractor.

41. Death or Permanent Invalidity of Contractor
If the Contractor is an individual or a proprietary concern, partnership concern, dies

during the currency of the contract or becomes permanently incapacitated, where
the surviving partners are only minors, the contract shall be closed without levying
any damages/ compensation as provided for in clause 28.2 of the contract
agreement. However, if the competent authority is satisfied about the competence




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

of the survivors, then the competent authority shall enter into a fresh agreement for
the remaining work strictly on the same terms and conditions under which the

contract was awarded.

42, Jurisdiction
This contract has been entered into the State of Madhya Pradesh and its validity,
construction, interpretation and legal effect shall be subjected to the courts at the
place where this agreement is entered into. No other jurisdiction shall be applicable.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
Contract Data

Clause Particulars Data
reference
1.14 Employer Water Resources Department
1.15 Engineer E.E. E/M H. M. Division, W.R. Deptt.Sagar
1.16 Engineer in Charge E.E. E/M H. M. Division, W.R. Deptt. Sagar
1.22 Stipulated period of completion 12 Months
3 Language & Law of Contract English & Indian Contract Act 1872
4 Address & contact details of the Format H of ITB
Contractor
Address & contact details of the E.E. E/M H.M. Division, W.R. Deptt.Sagar
Employer/ Engineer — phone, Fax, | Fax 07582-236764
e-mail. eeemhmsagar@rediffmail.com
5 Subcontracting permitted for the Not permitted
Contract Value
6 Technical Personnel to be Format |-3 of ITB
provided by the contractor —
requirement, &
Penalty, if required Technical Rs.
Personnel not employed
10 Specifications As per Annexure — E of ITB
Drawings As per Annexure - N
12 Competent Authority for deciding
dispute under Dispute Resolution Chief Engineer E/M W.R. Deptt. Bhopal
System
Appellate Authority for deciding
dispute under Dispute Resolution S.E. E/M Circle, Water Resources Deptt.Gwalior
System
13 Period for submission of updated N.A.
construction program
Amount to be withheld for not RS woeteeee e e
submitting construction program
in the prescribed period
14 Competent Authority for granting
Time Extension Chief Engineer E/M W.R. Deptt. Bhopal
15 Milestones laid down for the No
contract
If Yes, details of Milestones As per Annexure - O
Liquidated damage As per Annexure - P
17 List of equipment for lab As per Annexure - Q
Time to establishlab | -
Penalty for not establishing field Rs. -------- per month for the delay
Laboratory
18 Defect Liability Period ........ Months after Physical Completion of work
21 Competent Authority for
determiningtherate | e
27 Any other condition for breach of
contract | e
28 Penalty Shall include

(a) Security deposit as per clause 30 and
(b) Liquidated Damages imposed as per clause 15 of
general condition of contract or or Performance




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
Guarantee whichever is higher.
29 Performance guarantee shall be Till issue of Completion Certificate as per Clause 35.1
valid up to
30 Security Deposit to be deducted At the rate of 5%.
from each running bill
Maximum limit of deduction of Up to 5% of Final Contract Amount.
Security Deposit
31 Price Adjustment formula and Annexure R
procedure to calculate
31.1(1) | Price adjustment shall be If the amount put to tender is more than Rs 10 Crores
applicable and shall not have any bearing with the Contract
Amount.
32 Mobilization Advance applicable NO Mobilization Advance
Construction Machinery Advance NO Construction Machinery Advance
applicable
Type & Amount of Advance 1. Mobilization advance - Not more than ... % of
payment that can be paid contract amount
2. Construction Machinery Advance — Not more than
... % of contract amount
Unconditional Bank Guarantee In the format prescribed in Annexure — S
Rate of interest chargeable on N.A.
advances
Recovery of advance payment N.A.
33 Secured Advance applicable NO
Amount of Secured Advance 75% of value of material as determined by the
Engineer in Charge
Unconditional Bank Guarantee In the format prescribed in Annexure — T
Conditions for secured advance N.A.
Recovery of Secured advance N./A
Completion Certificate — after Annexure - U
physical completion of the
35 Work
Detailed Completion Certificate | Annexure-V
— after final payment on
completion of the Work
36 Competent Authority
39 Salient features of some of the | Annexure-W
major labour laws that are
applicable
41 Competent Authority Chief Engineer, E/M Water Resources Deptt. Bhopal




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

ANNEXURE - N
(See clause 10 of Section 3 — GCC)

Drawings

List of drawings —




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

ANNEXURE-0O

(See clause 15 of Section 3 -GCC)

Details of Milestones




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

ANNEXURE - P

(See clause 15 of Section 3 -GCC)
Compensation for Delay

If the contractor fails to achieve the milestones, and the delay in execution of work is
attributable to the contractor, the Employer shall retain an amount from the sums
payable and due to the contractor as per following scale -

i. Slippage up to 25% in financial target during the milestone under consideration
— 2.5% of the work remained unexecuted in the related time span.

ii. Slippage exceeding 25% but Up to 50% in financial target during the milestone
under consideration
- 5% of the work remained unexecuted in the related time span..

iii. Slippage exceeding 50% but Up to 75% in financial target during the milestone
under consideration
-7.5% of the work remained unexecuted in the related time span..

iv. Slippage exceeding 75% in financial target during the milestone under
consideration
-10% of the work remained unexecuted in the related time span.

Note: For arriving at the dates of completion of time span related to different milestones,
delays which are not attributable to the Contractor shall be considered. The slippage
on any milestone is if made good in subsequent milestones or at the time of
stipulated period of completion, the amount retained as above shall be refunded. In
case the work is not completed within the stipulated period of completion along
with all such extensions which are granted to the Contractor for either Employer’s
default or Force Majeure, the compensation shall be levied on the contractor at the
rate of 0.05% per day of delay limited to a maximum of 10% of contract price.

The decision of Superintending Engineer shall be final and binding upon both the
parties.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

ANNEXURE -Q

(See clause 17 of Section 3 -GCC)

List of Equipment for Quality Control Lab




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

ANNEXURE - R

(See clause 31 of Section 3 -GCC)
Price Adjustment

The formulas for adjustment of price are as follow:
R= Value of work as defined in Clause 31.2(3) of General Conditions of Contract

Weightages* of component in the work

Sno Component Percent.age of
component in the work
1 Cement - P,
2 | Steel -Ps
3 Bitumen - Py,
4 | POL- P;
* Weightages of various components of the work shall be as determined by the

competent technical sanction authority.

Adjustment for cement component

(ii) Price adjustment for increase or decrease in the cost of cement
procured by the contractor shall be paid in accordance with the
following formula:

V= 0.85 x P¢/100 X R x (Cl-Co)/Co

V= increase or decrease in the cost of work during the month under
consideration due to changes in rates for cement.
Co=  The all India wholesale price index for Grey cement on the date of opening of

Bids as published by the Ministry of Industrial Development, Government of
India, New Delhi. (www.eaindustry.nic.in)

C;=  The all India average wholesale price index for Grey cement for the month
under consideration as published by Ministry of Industrial Development,
Government of India, New Delhi.(www.eaindustry.nic.in)

P.= Percentage of cement component of the work

Note : For the application of this clause, index of Grey Cement has been chosen to
represent Cement group.

Adjustment of steel component
(iii) Price adjustment for increase or decrease in the cost of steel procured by the
Contractor shall be paid in accordance with the following formula:
Vi=  0.85x Psx /100 x R X (S1-S0)/So
V= Increase or decrease in the cost of work during the month under
consideration due to changes in the rates for steel.




N.L.T. No.

Note :

628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
The all India wholesale price index for steel (Bars and Rods) on the date of
opening of Bids as published by the Ministry of Industrial Development,
Government of India, New Delhi. (www.eaindustry.nic.in)

The all India average wholesale price index for steel (Bars and Rods) for the
month under consideration as published by Ministry of Industrial
Development, New Delhi. (www.eaindustry.nic.in)

Percentage of steel component of the work.

For the application of this clause, index of Bars and Rods has been chosen to
represent steel group.

Adjustment of bitumen component

(iv)

Price adjustment for increase or decrease is the cost of bitumen shall be paid
in accordance with the following formula:
Vo= 0.85x Pb/ 100xRx( Bi— Bo) / Bo

Vb= Increase or decrease in the cost of work during the month under
consideration due to changes in rates for bitumen.

Bo=  The official retail price of bitumen at the I0C depot at nearest
center on the date of opening of Bids.

Bi- The official retail price of bitumen of IOC depot at nearest center for
the 15" day of the month under consideration.

Po=  Percentage of bitumen component of the work.

Adjustment of POL (fuel and lubricant) component

(V)

Note :

Price adjustment for increase or decrease in cost of POL ( fuel and lubricant)
shall be paid in accordance with the following formula:

Vi= 0.85 x Ps/ 100 x R x ( Fi—Fo) / Fo

Vi=  Increase or decrease in the cost of work during the month under
consideration due to changes in rates for fuel and lubricants.

Fo=  The official retail price of High Speed Diesel (HSD) at the existing
consumer pumps of I0C at nearest center on the date of opening of
Bids.

Fi= The official retail price of HSD at the existing consumer pumps of 10C
at nearest center for the 15" day of month of the under
consideration.

Pt=  Percentage of fuel and lubricants component of the work.

For the application of this clause, the price of High Speed Diesel has been
chosen to represent fuel and lubricants group.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — S
(See clause 32 of Section 3 -GCC)

Bank Guarantee Form for Mobilization and Construction Machinery Advance
To

[name of Employer]

[address of Employer]

[name of Contractor]

In accordance with the provisions of the General Conditions of Contract, clause 31
("Mobilization and Construction Machinery Advance") of the above-mentioned Contract
[name and address of Contractor] (hereinafter called "the

Contractor") shall deposit with [name of Employer] a bank guarantee to
guarantee his proper and faithful performance under the said Clause of the Contract in an
amount of [amount of Guarantee]* [in
words].

We, the [bank of financial institution], as instructed by the
Contractor, agree unconditionally and irrevocably to guarantee as primary obligator and not
as surety merely, the payment to [name of Employer] on his first
demand without whatsoever right of obligation on our part and without his first claim to the
Contractor, in the amount not exceeding [amount of guarantee]*

[in words].

We further agree that no change or addition to or other modification of the terms of
the Contractor or Works to be performed thereunder or of any of the Contract documents
which may be made between [name of Employer] and the Contractor,
shall in any way release us from any liability under this guarantee, and we hereby waive

notice of any such change, addition or modification.
This guarantee shall remain valid and in full effect from the date of the advance
payment under the Contract until [name of Employer] receives full

repayment of the same amount from the Contractor.
Yours truly,
Signature and Seal :

Name of Bank/Financial Institution:
Address :
Date :

* An amount shall be inserted by the Bank or Financial Institution representing the
amount of the Advance Payment, and denominated in Indian Rupees.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — T
(See clause 33 of Section 3 -GCC)

Bank Guarantee Form for Secured Advance

INDENTURE FOR SECURED ADVANCES
This indenture made the day of 20  BETWEEN

(hereinafter called the contractor which expression shall where the context
so admits or implies be deemed to include his executors, administrators and assigns) or the
one part and the Employer of the other part.

Whereas by an agreement dated (hereinafter called the

said agreement) the contractor has agreed.

AND WHEREAS the contractor has applied to the Employer that he may be
allowed advanced on the security of materials absolutely belonging to him and brought by
him to the site of the works the subject of the said agreement for use in the construction of
such of the works as he has undertaken to executive at rates fixed for the finished work
(inclusive of the cost of materials and labour and other charges)

AND WHEREAS the Employer has agreed to advance to the Contractor the

sum of Rupees on the security of materials the quantities

and other particulars of which are detailed in Accounts of Secured Advance attached to the
Running Account Bill for the said works signed by the Contractor on and the
Employer has reserved to himself the option of making any further advance or advances on
the security of other materials brought by the Contractor to the site of the said works.

Now THIS INDENTURE WITNESSETH that in pursuance of the said agreement
and in consideration of the sum of Rupees on or before the execution of these
presents paid to the Contractor by the Employer (the receipt where of the Contractor doth
hereby acknowledge) and of such further advances (if any) as may be made to him as a for

said the Contractor doth hereby covenant and agree with the President and declare as

follows:
That the said sum of Rupees so advanced by the Employer to
(1) the Contractor as aforesaid and all or any further sum of sums advanced as aforesaid

shall be employed by the Contractor in or towards expending the execution of the

said works and for no other purpose whatsoever.




(2)

(3)

(4)

(5)

(6)

(7)

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

That the materials details in the said Account of Secured Advances which have been
offered to and accepted by the Employer as security are absolutely the Contractor's
own propriety and free from encumbrances of any kind and the contractor will not
make any application for or receive a further advance on the security of materials
which are not absolutely his own property and free from encumbrances of any kind
and the Contractor indemnified the Employer against all claims to any materials in
respect of which an advance has be made to him as aforesaid.

That the materials detailed in the said account of Secured Advances and all other
materials on the security of which any further advance or advances may hereafter be
made as aforesaid (hereafter called the said materials) shall be used by the
Contractor solely in the execution of the said works in accordance with the directions
of the Engineer.

That the Contractor shall make at his own cost all necessary and adequate
arrangements for the proper watch, safe custody and protection against all risks of
the said materials and that until used in construction as aforesaid the said materials
shall remain at the site of the said works in the Contractor's custody and on his own
responsibility and shall at all times be open to inspection by the Engineer or any
officer authorized by him. In the event of the said materials or any part thereof
being stolen, destroyed or damaged or becoming deteriorated in a greater degree
than is due to reasonable use and wear thereof the Contractor will forthwith replace
the same with other materials of like quality or repair and make good the same
required by the Engineer.

That the said materials shall not be removed from the site of the said works except
with the written permission of the Engineer or an officer authorized by him on that
behalf.

That the advances shall be repayable in full when or before the Contract receives
payment from the Employer of the price payable to him for the said works under the
terms and provisions of the said agreement. Provided that if any intermediate
payments are made to the Contractor on account of work done than on the occasion
of each such payment the Employer will be at liberty to make a recovery from the
Contractor's bill for such payment by deducting there from the value of the said
materials than actually used in the construction and in respect of which recovery has
not been made previously, the value for this purpose being determined in respect of
each description of materials at the rates at which the amounts of the advances
made under these presents were calculated.

That if the Contractor shall at any time make any default in the performance or
observance in any respect of any of the terms and provisions of the said agreement
or of these presents the total amount of the advance or advances that may still be
owing of the Employer shall immediately on the happening of such default be re-

payable by the Contractor to be the Employer together with interest thereon at




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

(8)

(9)

(10)

twelve percent per annum from the date or respective dates of such advance or
advances to the date of repayment and with all costs, charges, damages and
expenses incurred by the Employer in or for the recovery thereof or the enforcement
of this security or otherwise by reason of the default of the Contractor and the
Contractor hereby covenants and agrees with the Employer to reply and pay the
same respectively to him accordingly.

That the Contractor hereby charges all the said materials with the repayment to the

Employer of the said sum of Rupees and any

further sum of sums advanced as aforesaid and all costs, charges, damages and
expenses payable under these presents PROVIDED ALWAYS and it is hereby agreed
and declared that notwithstanding anything in the said agreement and without
prejudice to the power contained therein if and whenever the covenant for payment
and repayment here-in-before contained shall become enforceable and the money
owing shall not be paid in accordance there with the Employer may at any time
thereafter adopt all or any of the following courses as he may deem best:

(a) Seize and utilise the said materials or any part thereof in the competion of
the said works on behalf of the contractor in accordance with the provision in
that behalf contained in the said agreement debiting the contractor with the
actual cost of effecting such completion and the amount due to the
contractor with the value of work done as if he had carried it out in
accordance with the said agreement and at the rates thereby provided. If the
balance is against the contractor, he is to pay same to the Employer on
demand.

(b) Remove and sell by public auction the seized materials or any part thereof
and out of the moneys arising from the sale retain all the sums aforesaid
repayable or payable to the Employer under these presents and pay over the
surplus (if any) to the Contractor.

(Q Deduct all or any part of the moneys owing out of the security deposit or any
sum due to the Contractor under the said agreement.

That except in the event of such default on the part of the contractor as aforesaid

interest on the said advance shall not be payable.

That in the event of any conflict between the provisions of these presents and the

said agreement the provisions of these presents shall prevail and in the event of any

dispute or difference arising over the construction or effect of these presents the
settlement of which has not been here-in-before expressly provided for the same
shall be referred to the Employer whose decision shall be final and the provision of
the Indian Arbitration Act for the time being in force shall apply to any such

reference.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure — U
(See clause 35 of Section 3 -GCC))

Physical Completion Certificate

Name 0f WOTK: oo e e e e e
Agreement no. .......ccceeeeeee.. Date e
Amount of Contract RS .......coevvvvrveen

Name of AGENCY : cceovvueririirer e s

Last measurement recorded on date -------------=------

Certified that the above mentioned work was physically completed on ................... (date)
and taken over on ............... (date) and that I have satisfied myself to best of my
ability that the work has been done properly.

Date of issue

Executive Engineer




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure -V
(See clause 35 of Section 3 -GCC)

Detailed Completion Certificate

Name of WOrK: .....ccooccriiiiin e e
Agreement no. .......cccceeeeeee.. Date coveeiiiiiiiiiie

Name Of AGENCY : ..vverieeeertiees e e

Agreemented amount Rs. .......ccccceeenne.
Final Amount paid to contractor Rs. -----------=--=--=----

Incumbency of officers for the work

[ have satisfied myself to best of my ability that the work has been done properly.

Date of issue

Executive Engineer




c)

g)

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Annexure - W
(See clause 39 of Section 3 -GCC)

Salient Features of Some Major Labour Laws Applicable

Workmen Compensation Act 1923: - The Act provides for compensation in case of
injury by accident arising out of and during the course of employment.

Payment of Gratuity Act 1972: - Gratuity is payable to an employee under the Act on
satisfaction of certain conditions on separation if an employee has completed the
prescribed minimum years (say, five years) of service or more or on death the rate of
prescribed minimum days’(say, 15 days) wages for every completed year of service.
The Act is applicable to all establishments employing the prescribed minimum
number (say, 10) or more employees.

Employees P.F. and Miscellaneous Provision Act 1952: The Act Provides for monthly
contributions by the Employer plus workers at the rate prescribed (say, 10% or
8.33%). The benefits payable under the Act are:

i. Pension or family pension on retirement or death as the case may be.

ii. Deposit linked insurance on the death in harness of the worker.

iii. Payment of P.F. accumulation on retirement/death etc.

Maternity Benefit Act 1951: - The Act provides for leave and some other benefits to
women employees in case of confinement or miscarriage etc.

Contract Labour (Regulation & Abolition) Act 1970: - The Act provides for certain
welfare measures to be provided by the Contractor to contract labour and in case
the Contractor fails to provide, the same are required to be provided, by the
Principal Employer by Law. The principal Employer is required to take Certificate of
Registration and the Contractor is required to take license from the designated
Officer. The Act is applicable to the establishments or Contractor of Principal
Employer if they employ prescribed minimum (say 20) or more contract labour.

Minimum Wages Act 1948: - The Employer is to pay not less than the Minimum
Wages fixed by appropriate Government as per provisions of the Act if the
employment is a scheduled employment. Construction of buildings, roads, runways
is scheduled employment.

Payment of Wages Act 1936: - It lays down as to by what date the wages are to be
paid, when it will be paid and what deductions can be made from the wages of the
workers.

Equal Remuneration Act 1979: - The Act provides for payment of equal wages for
work of equal nature to male and female workers and for not making discrimination
against female employees in the matters of transfers, training and promotions etc.

Payment of Bonus Act 1965: - The Act is applicable to all establishments employing
prescribed minimum (say, 20) or more workmen. The Act provides for payments of
annual bonus within the prescribed range of percentage of wages to employees
drawing up to the prescribed amount of wages, calculated in the prescribed manner.




j)

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

The Act does not apply to certain establishments. The newly set-up establishments
are exempted for five years in certain circumstances. States may have different
number of employment size.

Industrial Disputes Act 1947: - The Act lays down the machinery and procedure for
resolution of industrial disputes, in what situations a strike or lock-out becomes
illegal and what are the requirements for laying off or retrenching the employees or
closing down the establishment.

Industrial Employment (Standing Orders) Act 1946: - It is applicable to all
establishments employing prescribed minimum (say, 100, or 50). The Act provides
for laying down rules governing the conditions of employment by the Employer on
matters provided in the Act and gets these certified by the designated Authority.

Trade Unions Act 1926: - The Act lays down the procedure for registration of trade
unions of workmen and Employers. The Trade Unions registered under the Act have
been given certain immunities from civil and criminal liabilities.

Child Labour (Prohibition & Regulation) Act 1986: - The Act prohibits employment
of children below 14 years of age in certain occupations and processes and provides
for regulations of employment of children in all other occupations and processes.
Employment of child labour is prohibited in building and construction industry.

Inter-State Migrant Workmen’s (Regulation of Employment & Conditions of
Service) Act 1979: - The Act is applicable to an establishment which employs
prescribed minimum (say, five) or more inter-state migrant workmen through an
intermediary (who has recruited workmen in one state for employment in the
establishment situated in another state). The Inter-State migrant workmen, in an
establishment to which this Act becomes applicable, are required to be provided
certain facilities such as Housing, Medical-Aid, Travelling expenses from home up to
the establishment and back etc.

The Building and Other Construction workers (Regulation of Employment and
Conditions of Service) Act 1996 and the Cess Act of 1996: - All the establishments
who carry on any building or other construction work and employs the prescribed
minimum (say, 10) or more workers are covered under this Act. All such
establishments are required to pay cess at the rate not exceeding 2% of the cost of
construction as may be modified by the Government. The Employer of the
establishment is required to provide safety measures at the building or construction
work and other welfare measures, such as canteens, first-aid facilities, ambulance,
housing accommodations for workers near the work place etc. The Employer to
whom the Act applies has to obtain a registration certificate from the Registering
Officer appointed by the Government.

Factories Act 1948: - The Act lays down the procedure for approval of plans before
setting up a factory, health and safety provisions, welfare provisions, working hours,
annual earned leave and rendering information regarding accidents or dangerous
occurrences to designated authorities. It is applicable to premises employing the
prescribed minimum (say, 10) persons or more with aid of power or another
prescribed minimum (say, 20) or more persons without the aid of power engaged in
manufacturing process.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

SECTION 3

Conditions of Contract
Part — II Special Conditions of Contract

Additional Special Conditions of tender

[um—

QTR o 3TTCRT 3R SheR Y Ceh $ITCATeT oh THY S.TH.EY. &I Sil &I $Foh TR AP &l

3HY TR SFH FT $ITATT JUh H SheR ol fohar S|

fRfaeTerR 1 s7dliet YTl 3ideTd it 36, 3T IAEEA Online TEdd AT g

fAfderer &l Coieh &1 Sir.ud &1 ISTEERA Online T AT BT

roe! e a 7 3mIet ST &7 9AT0T 3R doid 2 TEd LT 81|

fAIETRR Y TesFelloR o TR TIGETABTR / TATATONT AT T FE] T FeAT g1 |

3%d fATAeT deTd IR I 3TaRTS ST [ATderhR CdRT (Mandatory Documents) —

PAN CARD, EPF, ESI, EMD, %/ 31T 7 IoiiaeT 1 ufa scarfe; TeldeT el gIam 3T

fAfaer AT =181 1 et

7. fAfaeTehR Y AT T 9 Hefast T 3T &

8. $-3UHST (e-EMD) FTHT FX AT 7 19T ot arel fAfaererrt & forr Rt ufsrar Ratia
Fr ST & — (1) AT & 90T o arel AfAEreR 319a s 3RS AT ST T 3-
JFARAT qieeT (https://mptenders.gov.in/ nicgep/app) T 3=t FI'\IJ?T—EFI' Hlé'.éﬁ'. a FI'T?T—é?-T
X S 13T 3ol BiF H Gof hiaT|
(1) fAf3eTR RTGS/NEFT/Debit Card/Credit Card/Net Banking & HTETH & STH.IY. (e-
EMD) & TR GIEeT TR STAT Y Fehal, 3He a1G o TATIET 3 197 ofet hr shryarér qot et

9. faccr T Gelol & G wgeTciH [Afderehr T $-EUASY (e-EMD) UTA FI BIgaT AW
Foft FATaeTRT garT STAT $.0A 3N, (e-EMD) 9id & ATe#H & fer arag &1 el 3y fom
AR & AIEa I @A & &Y arad grefr| Ig Tase fohar S1ar & 6 $-Suasy s Hr afr
UIEeT et arel AfagrrR Rt off @i @ $-STASY (EMD) & Hehd 8, We] aradr
fAfaeeR & IS dF @ra # & gieft| awer AfageR $r $3UAST (e-EMD) & Ufr
3TIeIET ST cleh JehT T ST AT 3fefaiey foysTesT fohd Silet & TR arad hr S |

10. I foreT FROT & $.TAZY. (EMD) ISTAT et T 01 fordm Sirar § df [ fageeR gant
STHT $.THZN. (e-EMD) &Y T Wicel W TSTATT T SIRET AT IeraTd v Iy Uiy afda
WATSsY GaRT R [aemela Sl wdes 3 farar. iy #efed STor SarersT
FHTT TR & 8443 RAfaer AT @a 7 S 7 SRef 5 Fafia @1 & 9”& gan
ATeATeT & HATETH I TS WIrear 0702 Y 37 STAT g STeh |

11. 3faRed wwrdT aTRE 38 ueg 7 o STRel foae e Al / awwred | T (Earnest
Money/Performance Guarantee) il SiTcil g |

12. Additional performance guarantee WW?W@W forsarfea frar smem|

13. Additional performance guarantee $ifcieh & & HII EI'\UﬁHT 9ATOT 9 (Physical Completion

Certificate) STRT leT o IATH &1 ATIH hT ST |

A




24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

31.
32.

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
14, fAf3eT 3regeer & gxdrdsit I dfder Hed . 50.00 o T TI 1000/- AT F. 50.00

O 3T I HIAST Hod 1 0.1 FTRIeT T o FHTAT T631T| TS ATHT SaNT SH Yoeh
IS TR fohar ST1a & o Tt IRFEf 7 sreer & woa yafod o X Ty ek
CEICIRIEN

15. 91 ROT §aTv fAfder TR / 3edihd F¥e 1 QT SR fAfder AaEsorehdT S
g |

16. 37oIeer T Efe Y HT URT 14.1 & AR T FASolelh I Sl TR Y:
Y & FgATT & TR dordl ST Fehell B

17. ST.ET.EY. Fellor 8.1 H Ieli@d “Physical Property” & 3iddTd 3= qREAUTcadr & arar
TISTAT & Y 37GTT (AN Ud faga#TeT) $i FiFAferd gier|

18. AT T SGEAT HTAIHATHAR TS AT TGS ST Thell o |

19. 3.97.U%. U4 5.09.3775 ). [AHWT & garT red gsiiget $r afd Foloed HY|

20. HETIH HH HYerd GART SR e ATSHE T ST 3Tl 15T 3Tels A |

21. AT FR A Gfeel T GET hT STATEERT FEAUT 1 g9f| kg Fafee i fanedr ofr
TR T g1feT T &7fy glet Sl AT & SoheR Sccerd g1 U 38 FaTs TR eanry
feRe emerehrar WY hr &Tfayfct el graft forerehT aefell aTe; IT IroTea I TehraT [T
T G aHeT 1 S|

22. HTA® H SFARY/HTHRIIT HRON T T W AT HTAS T TIEdT EAT A HIEAT
gref|

23. AT HY & FHRT HARRYHHATRT GIRT FATOIT SUTEUTT FHTOT-0F TITHTE $TcTeT
3T & AT HeATeT Blot & ST &1 SIS fohaT S|

HTAFT & TEe/ATA-dieT FT cTTTAT & TET 7 [IHIT T IS FATGGRT AT g1 | TEAT GaRT

FraUTTaR AHeH I vem HT TR

THRY ISR & FHAURET T A TR IGAT 1T T 3eTeh GaRT &8 T fAERATER

e e e

SRS gaRT F TUT W RAT TR HT AATVATCIT FHT 3TART el TR FHIT garT 378

TcahTel T TAeT T 37T Y AT ST TUT TSTET GaRT 3T HTH Sl STTEAT dcohlel el

graf|

QTHARIT TTRTL/AGRATEIT 3TTehIRI/ATCIgeh 37T gled WX 81 TSIl &l sfHH Hr

THGEAT T Blot I AT g1t |

T #fHF P TS W 3YTRTYT 7T 81T & 37UaT S & SRIA JHATY YT SIar § ar gia

A gfafes T9 1000/- & AT § UGUS THAT |

3739 ageTaTeT Rt ot oty 3t 1t R S e fvfareT wsfar sRia #ifdent &t aX

HHRI SN GART AR e 9T 3T haT ST gram, foierent |reg ot wicraATe Fedd

R STTaT 31faar ghem|

A FI AR FAT R 39TEUT W1 gher|

3T, FegTie; T Il FAIHATTER & S|

fATaeTer/aEdT garT fa/ar HRY HLML STel AT HHT HER & HI &I &¥cd o o qa

ToreT sfRen! &1 Fardf veret & RN 37k A1, qoT dr, 3y, wiet, Afdwd fheaa va gfow

HcIT9sT YATOT-9F 3UcTeY T ITIard g1 |




33.

34.
35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

42.

43.

44,

45.

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026
foreT FRUTERr 3PN #fAF Teer ST § a 3aH G AfdeeR garT derel AT S

ShTeh-32 TTHR FHE Ta0T o AT TN &l SIS HITAT g1t |

FAI-FAT W TR 3T ganry & 713 fgeit 1 Iretet a¥ar Afard gham|

ATHeRT SART ATe TR HTUHRT § are-faare fomar Sirem & ot Ty 31TepRY garT 38 doshrel
JHTT H §SIAT AT |

fAfder & AfART T e 47 HPFT SeaR & AR N 718 &, fTHd AT & el (fus.),
3FORY (3.UH.3S.) AiFAfad ei 8 |

FE & eI IS S AR qieaned yar Fcg & 9red giar ¢ ar 36 fodr fasmr
SccRerT # gt glamm|

TET/TSHET T TSIeT JHTOT-TH/IeR Tehe He eI Uoiiiel JHTOT FEd el JHielary § adr
THAT FFIFAAA Tare, IS H3 T ofel T T 38 W o] afl S 311 Siar st
et S T ITeTeT et T Scaal Icd [ATIGIRR T gIaT|

F W R T DRIGR/ASR 6T Y 18 T { FHH 7T gleAT AT AAT 3eTehr ATH, YT Il
T 3Ty Heel STeTehRT SUREATC THTOT I & HTY STt a1 ITaRTeh gIa |

FRI R AR I A TAE/AHIGR T 47 3T FaI, AEITGL TaRT AR X I 37Tt
R ST 31fary grem|

TordT &t AUTRE ar o $.d1.u. T $.0H.3178 HY 7 37Tt et gIa |

T ATHRT T ST e Wl 7 e AT $-3[ITcAIe o ATEAH W AT gl

FHARAT & AT ¥ 3Tl 3,91 0%, /5.0q.3m$ 1Y Fr Tf sl & Fay 7 voidt & 71w
dcfel o AT faROT T T GIaTT AT Heldll Y TS RN STAT §let T THTOT 3TeTh &I &
& o S|

fATETeR g@RT STell afY & 4 3Pl HATeT Seak I (Including EPFO and ESIC) &X &
A AT glell ANV AT AT FFdd (Bid) IR fEaR g o Siem|

fATIETARY SaRT FA X YEdd A H TUT & TSRl I T FE § gIed 3egeid
& MUR | GAAFAT & Sraan|

Signature of bidder/Machine Owner Executive Engineer,
E/M,H. M. Division
Permanent Address Water Resources Department,

Sagar




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

SECTION 4

BILL OF QUANTITIES

"G"-Schedule for Supply of High Skilled Labour (Operator) for Operation of Government
' Machinery under E/M FOM Sub Division Sagar

S. No. Description of Work Quantity Rate Unit Amount Remarks
| 2 3 4 5 6 7
I Regarding the Supply of High 6 16494.00 Per 98964.00 As per Labour
Skilled “Labour (Operator) for Month Commissioner
Gov. Machine Operation under Indore Order
E/M Heavy Machinery Division, No.1/11/vUos-
Sagar /ar=/2024/2486
6-25105 =N,
[ERIE
01.10.2025
Total Rs. 98964.00
Add Extra Charge for EPF,| 13.00% Rs. 12865.00
Add Extra Charge for ESL,|  3.25% Rs. 3216.00
Contractors Profit|  10.00% Rs. 9896.00
lotal Rs. 124941.00
For 12 Month (Rs. 124941 x 12 Month) Total Rs. 1499292.00
Grand Total|  Rs. 1499292.00
[say Rs. 1499 [ akhs

(In words)

Note:- 1. Payment will be made as per Rules.

Rs. Fourteen Lakhs Ninty Nine Thousand Only

2 This Contract is for Twelve Months on the same terms & conditions as given in

Agreement.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

SECTION 5
AGREEMENT FORM
Agreement
This agreement, made the day of
between (name and address of Employer) (hereinafter called " the
Employer) and (name and address of

contractor) hereinafter called "the Contractor" of the other part.
Whereas the Employer is desirous that the Contractor execute
(name and

identification number of Contract) (hereinafter called "the Works") and the Employer has
accepted the Bid by the Contractor for the execution and completion of such Works and the
remedying of any defects therein, at a cost of Rs.

NOW THIS AGREEMENT WITNESSETH as follows:

1. In this Agreement, words and expression shall have the same meanings as are
respectively assigned to them in the conditions of contract hereinafter referred to and they
shall be deemed to form and be read and construed as part of this Agreement.

2. In consideration of the payments to be made by the Employer to the Contractor as
hereinafter mentioned, the Contractor hereby covenants with the Employer to execute and
complete the Works and remedy any defects therein in conformity in all aspects with the
provisions of the contract.

3. The Employer hereby covenants to pay the Contractor in consideration of the
execution and completion of the Works and the remedying the defects wherein Contract
Price or such other sum as may become payable under the provisions of the Contract at the
times and in the manner prescribed by the Contract.

4, The following documents shall be deemed to form and be ready and construed as
part of this Agreement viz.

i Letter of Acceptance
ii. Contractor's Bid
iii. Condition of Contract: Ge [46] 1 Special

iv. Contract Data

V. Bid Data

vi. Drawings

vii. Bill of Quantities and

viii. Any other documents listed in the Contract Data as forming part of the Contract.

In witnessed whereof the parties there to have caused this Agreement to be
executed the day and year first before written.
The Common Seal of was

hereunto affixed in the presence of:
Signed, Sealed and Delivered by the said

in the

presence of :
Binding Signature of Employer

Binding Signature of Contractor




i i .04.2026
N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04

HEAYSY YR

S St R
' AT . ~
BHIG U 17-1/2010 /19 /&7 / L IRY e /03 /2015
‘ B eI '
1 Wﬁvmrzﬁmﬂmmwféﬂfm 29082011 ERT AY. 9IRM & fywfor
/B0 /s /et % Saant B b Coi AR B T gy

T & amder wwies 78829671/ 19 /A 1% 19.11.1099 (Bramfy -
W) & AR e @ USRS B Rrerely Ao ¥ s ey (Demotion), e
@ (Cancellation), Foifig BT (Suspension) vd SPHIR o A1 Y Prefl el
STSr! (Black listing) @81 wrefardy o Fider Ry WY 48 ot ferar v 8 fo5
SS9 A1, SUspension e Black Listing ol oidardy % smoefy | .
o2 HEfE RueT sues P gE NG srerar ereper IfersTd oy
e URREIRR § daRR @ W aren A A SO (Black listing) srerar Sygr
GO e P (Suspension) %Y prfaray DR A T

1. The affidavit/ Self ‘declaration contains any false information or suppresses any
- Material information. ‘ P 7
2.”8uch bidder whose bid is accepted fails to éxg;-cute the agreement. The
. Suspension.will. be in. addition to forfeiture . of his- earnest money ‘or any other
penalty imposed as perthe tender condition™ - )

3. Contractor fails to use mobijlization advance given to him for the purpose it was

Contractor faijls to renew the securities deposited to the department.
If documents submitted are found to be false, -
The contractor ig found to be non serious in executing the agreemented works or
- leaves the agreemented work incomplete, irmespective of the expiry of the full
contract period., ) ’
7. The contractor faiis to rectify any lapse(s) in quality of the work done within a
reasonable time. ) B
8. Contractor fails to maintain/repair/redo the work upto the expiry of performance
guarantee period, when it is specifically brought to his notice. o
9. On any other ground which is considered reasonable after re?:ording reason.

& o n




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

e iome R DR

i. During th pension neither his registration will be renewed nor
fresh registration will be issued.
ii. Black listed contractor will not be allowed fresh registration or renewal of his
registration till order of black listing is revoked or cancelled.
“iii.  Contractor or firms black listed or suspended or any of it's partner will not be
registered under any other name. .
iv.  Period of suspension should be for a definite period.

3. ddER @ Uohue PR $ slerEr 9 el 9§ e o Rl b

ey ATER B T B ER W S| \
A Srarar)

: He?méw T
e o el / FPE S ol e W ﬁIT{SFUT m'JTFT -
3$ T 17~ 1/2010/19/#[/ )/417 . %ﬁwa 1%7125\%//3/2015
_ yferferfR—

1 R g RICCRARIEE Tmfnw e fawmT J=erd |
T e aiRa AT ST 7 Ry /et wre) Rere

- TR /il ey FilHe! ﬁ“vm/?ﬁfﬁ foetor e/ #FIQ
S vemad Rer et @3re | i
: \/(@ .3- . wRg sfRiar e Fmtor R/ de varven aifyest /s
/

P - AT ﬁﬂm/maﬁﬁﬁﬂm/ﬁaﬁwmmﬁﬁw
ferrT R fmaraest sorg fmior 9ee AT | 5
4- e e sfvar e Frafer fe HOO |
5-  ond AWrer writ e sfr oA e e e P Jewge U
Sj&@?ﬂ : S | | MW)%PO@/
- (2 W RO j 9\
2”’/2 T R

(- FOT HEETF wrard) - g sfor frar
5‘& LA TRl




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

TEUTERT IR
SiE R o
AT, W

wHia 1119 /fa /PRy / 2016 e, s 3 Sp, 2016
4 Vg

fdam A R71% 01.01.2014 F SL PR v § ew-ar F ARy
R Wfdw wu 9 §und ww By S @ WeuE § | REi$ 01.06.2016 B
Wﬂmemﬁﬁa‘ﬁmﬁmﬁwmﬁmﬁﬁgwtﬁ Hifte W DA wAr fin
W@ WgErE @) g @ 5 gdae wu § W dynd). (E-guud)
ST 5 W @1 e ) fsa o £

TEoudl o ey FARET ¥ 9rr ol TR PRTeRl © 2R e
ufar RuaiRa o o 2
ARl 4 wrr o9 g AR e 9 seree @ WS TS T,

F-MERde oidd (https://www.mpeproc.gov.in) WX o @i sdd W
R HY I srprde et w18 § ol B4 |

ffagTeR RTGS/NEFT/Debid Card/Credit Card/ Net Banking <h WM @
SO @ IR D WS wY B S ag ¥ PR ¥ anr Y @)
BRIGE gdad H |

fawl enme gem @ Surid < Rfiger @ Sl @) i o
BlsaY A9 Wi Pfeerl gr1 o <yl & I odd @ Araw |
U @ Sl o 5 Aflger @ Odd o Wned 3w H ot

Bl | gl ug o far o & P S o a gy Rfieer
el @ | Sl o AR S R wet g ol PAifdETeR gR
Wes §o w4 & el

Wﬁrﬁmwaﬁs‘.{m.@. D AR AEH oY T AD IR W
ST <o sy fFrenfed R o @ ST o 9 e |

A el eror ¥ SwmE). o R o o Pl Ry @er @ A
Fleeer grr o -3uadl o i odd W womi @ ey e
ISTd @ Mg N AfEw NERe] gR1 gd wid qeE fanr @ el
Feg '@ (@S aase) § o @ ool R fgw o) B oRw. grn
ﬁmﬁa%quﬁwuﬁmomzaﬁﬁﬁwmwm

N

(fere IS YR
e
TGS TG

wet WEEE AT, W

36U




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

93

AW YT
STl WU ey
HAR, WMure
warer, e § BIH, 2016
J /AR /s

17 /af  aRif/ 0 15-16- @ s R W e=1i 1w,

2016 @ UEET AT o WY ared) @ el A Sdwmd wm
faan s 3| 3o &g PiRer gox § = et R iy 8

&

L ?3?!’91?’1‘»;2, Instructions to Bidders (ITB), A. GENERAL & C. Preparation

of Bid @ 39t F&foi—12 Docuements Comprising the Bid & W @
(iii) Earnest money & a1 (In case of EMD is deposited E lectronically
(e-EMD) the bidder need not produce the proof of EMD Deposit) ten
s s1er e & WH 17 ¥ Forms of Earest maony deposit ¥ *j)
FDR/e-FDR (i) Demand draft of scheduled commercial Bank i) Interest
bearing securities of post office & ¥T8 |, (iv) O e-EMD" STier Wy

(R W"‘W T o)y
g

ARYE T
el HAmE T, Wt

I F. 1117 /[T /ORI /AT / 15—16 AT, fawTie b S, 2018
wfafef—

GAWwN

WA
(ﬁmwm%q'“"
At
HEYST IR
ST darE fanT, e




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

r

1949 / 271 / 3-CeR / 201415 /
DAy W S
I e
WIS R e, JATIR W ()

L
: wre, e /el 2015
Tfd,
ST Hae R,

fo—rer s frT @ 3ot 4 ged ¥ W B AT D SR B waEd|

fie 1 SaR, 2014 & R fifder wom @ SR 150v) R wrer e
v ORI K Pl eaeied o | O GaRE R B Wl 3w, RF ger |
B M6 W BN W WA §, B el ® P wu & Yeee—a4 Bl of
Quanities ¥ =1 €w sifts frar wr gfifem a¥- \
"Excavation of Hard Rock will be paid to the contracto? as per agreemented rate,
The Hard Rock received from excavation and remains unutilised by the department
shall be at the disposal of the contractor. The contractor may use it at the same site or
may sale it to any other person or contractor. All the taxes, Royalty and other charges if
—-any-shali-be borne by {he coniracior: Necessary permits, pass, permissions required by
the' Mining act or any other act of the State Government or Central Government shall
be obtained by the contractor."
S B ISR W R B S areh P § ff sew dusifer R
ST gAY | S

—

i 5&3 VTR

& AN




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

PR AN

grwum 6

m‘@’ﬁﬁmﬁ# g, for m#msﬂmw@

Whnnan.' Qﬂﬂramea)ﬁﬂ‘mig ‘ g ;
o ((Jmo(kibko Rates) b i _wﬁm m:tﬁa‘atmﬁit

-

-

Page 84 0f 10§ -

-
-

o

A W s
\

) _—_*




e

B

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

. Py
el L Temaie

o7 i oy s B s f e gy andPE W ‘*ri?t’%?m i &zﬁﬁm%h l
Wy STET QO

@, Lt
a4y i-ﬁ'ﬂﬂf
w,'sr.sam, 3‘? ares AR

p, 7
7. W-22(AN326/MPSIBY 267 5 ﬂ:ﬁmf&m i 1 /0120
wirma - i L
1. Tg&reﬁ%‘zm‘r ﬁrfrwwvfﬁﬁw ATH L [
2 Wﬁmmw Fro & YTy, ST e o, sﬁm:
\ 3 - ﬂmﬂv —"mm!"i‘ 'F*E’nr m“acr*-ilsr B
4.
]
5
o |
. Wb Zii.’?,}.q : m;
- R A 13lo|
, maﬁa
; T, a*a-m%rﬁ‘ﬂ
v : .
.
-
>
o~
-
[ 4
e
2 !
: |
e
[
L
h\; i 5 .
- £ ‘e 3pE LIBLEVBAPS LETSERA15-17 doc doe 158/ / X
"J ; = vy 8 AR ST )
- )
~ :
)




— — =

N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

o - i

FAID 3441200 /65 /2016
Hraterd gz sifa
e W v iue song

“rare, ﬁ.”:ﬂ?ﬁ /12 /2018

- mmaﬁ@mqﬁ&aﬁmﬁm I
— UTEA B Ued Tl amnzoo/es/zme/na?/sra /16 /230112018,

!?m%rﬁﬁmmmdﬁmm”&#mmwmmw
/oM @ gt § gudr § ey e Prdw |
wraft o v mmm@hm@mammmmw |
mmmi%ﬂMWmmqu#wﬁMW
(Accredited) WART SRARIT ¥ Frafor Yorelt & e W wderor awmn o

b SRR B AR TSR A i e e ST sy ST
3 mw%mmm#ﬁmmm/ﬁémmmﬁmmn
- &y =
{e=ostio =)
JOHD 3441200 /65 /2018 / are fasies / ve4s618
wfaferfy, é!l’ww

1. Sifae, (To it JmonoaRE, S SwRE R Were, e
2 e SR A, oo amm R e | ;
8. TRUAST ot R o et 7 T B i ‘




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

x w383 / 271 /3T, / 201718 /
‘ wrafers wyer i
NERGIE ‘E'a’lTﬂT ST MR 1aR Jn-l\'vﬂ SN, Te!
e enc.etendering, Wrclmp@gmak!.c:om
Wl 0755 STETE3E 2573438 Uadd 0785 2564400

. idter, feafy S, 2017
— e

eiflers dolle wd il el wodo wRaT HIOTE G
A 1502 /'ﬂ"‘*"“ﬂu 11 /2016 Wi familie 22032016 BRI U widue
& wEae] WA 14012016 W WE L HETE 50C /-
e siftmer 25000 /- emmdlw ved gy OO wvardslogw wioi
THA ST R W 0,28 wiverRr werey vee w8

__,-

famarey & Qudie wn Refe 22.032016 6 alpui wrdad) @l ond
W I THIE WY W S B
&/
(ol g gwellar)
une iR

. let e RBaen g
USRS 353 /271 S EE. /201718 /20 0F Reiies ¢S, 2017
wlerrafg —

1. Eitiu i, weg wou vIEE, oe WHin GO

P T e, we e 1 1
T FElaTor WA, WS e ees T WEE @ gl

2

3

4, R grdares WAl e S W

5. oy e, wrafery wReem vigem, wdy, ww v e0s gy e
fefe Q= s, e @ olv Rwrha dwude womlE wwa 2y
AT |

Nowy® She)p
oy wAN Yereli)
W s
W R TR TS




i i .04.2026
N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2

AEgCY R
ix ]—.i::mm | .
TP UE 17-1/2010/ 19 /4t / - oRY Rere /03 /2015

j T % iy 89 T 81, a8 vt o oy &
o/ Shspension 3T Black Listing "ol sRiqe e onghi | )
E SRR Sven e SR SferaT Ve iy ey
— IR § SBeR 1 Amy e " gre
ol T 9 (Suspension) 31w my =

SRR TS

o 1o The affidavit/ Sejf ‘declaration contains any false inforniafion or suppresses any
. Aaterial information. i e
2.7Such bidder whose bid is accepted fails to éxecute the agreement. The
.. SUspension.will. be jj. addition to forfeiture of his- earnest money ‘or any other
. Ppenalty imposed as perthe tender condition” " - o
3. Contractor fails to yse mobilization advance given to him for the purpose it was
meant, . ;
4. Contractor fajls to renew the securities deposited to the department.
S. If documents submitted are found to be false. s
6. The contractor is found to be non serious in executing the agreemented works or
. leaves the agreemented work incomplete, irr:-:-spectfve'c_f the expiry of the full
contract period. L : y
7. The contractor fails to rectify any lapse(s) in quality of the work done within a
reasonable time. : : ' . _
8. Contractor fails to maintain/repair/redo the work Upto the expiry of performance
guarantee period, when it is specifically brought to his notice, ey j
S. On any other ground which is considered reasonable after recording reason,
: . | :

[




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001IE D P /2021-22/E in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

E. During the perlod of suspension neither his registration will be renewed nor
fresh registration will be issued.
ii. Black listed coniractor will not be allowed fresh registration or renewal of his
registration till order of black listing is revoked or cancelled.
“iii.  Contractor or firms black listed or suspended or any of it's partner will not be
registered under any other name. ;
iv.  Pericd of suspension should be for a definite perlod

3, ﬁawwqﬁwﬁaﬁamﬁmwww&ﬁﬁ#wﬁwﬁrﬂmmm

Hfﬂfﬁlﬁarqﬂwa%’rmﬂw%anﬂwwﬁﬁl
(=i, )
afa
AT AR
e e o - _-“;;--;__m____ s ‘@_95 ﬁ"ﬁq ﬁl‘TFT R R e
UF. T 17— 1/2010/19/#{/ 731% 5 ﬁmaﬁ*m%@/a/zms
R -

i amgmwﬁmwwvﬁwﬁmfﬁww I
\/2/ T GRS S el I [T /e el e

- e /i Wmﬁtﬁﬁwr/aﬁﬁm‘mﬁw /TG
2 e AR e qEes | 4
= 6’\ .«3------%&%#&5%%/% ey UifS) fr/ we
. / waRE T/ i wifie R/ RaTeET e die FEi
foparT RS R T fomfor e e |
4-  wew qeg e <re Frar w0 |
5- Sﬂéﬂﬁﬂaﬁmﬁ@m{maﬁﬁﬁ meﬂaﬁmﬁw

| aﬁsﬂﬁm | it fewmr

Mf




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

f" TR I

EEiLICEREEI
T
oot HaT HITe 462004
HHIB 22(7) 326—T/MPS /31 /14 qiure, & e 08/ 02 / 2024
. g S
ol aRE T,
YT |

fwa— oo garE fammr @ e yusr @ wiaeEt § Sees qaq
Haf— Udhd AT F. 600 /271 / 5—CUEN / 2023—24 HIUTA, f&H1EF 29.01.2024

o gaeE fomr & fAfeer o3 & greur ® oWeieE & gey A fdAie
07022024 ¥ fod T wywewm ol R Wam yuE ¥ Iedilad SfedrRn #
AT ®1 59 OTEE g1 aTgAifed B Simem 2 |
2) W YUF AR WA H. 1 T8 2 W Iealigd FUEE T grr oy &

W arelt aEwT fAfagmeil oy ang g
3) WA F. 3 ¥ 12 W Sifdhad FUUA ges Ud Hegq URIIAR & o @l @
fafagmen o= @I B |
4) Tad HOEH Sfd A 99T @ oat @ g @ g
Hel{— IUREAER
YT B AU & A o
aarraxﬁsnaﬂﬂ
u"g/(r f’ELt
(&g, o)
EL :
HY. 9T, o garE e
USIHd HHIG 22(T) 326—T,/ MPS /31 /{ 4g a1, feAid 02/ 02 / 2024

gfeferf —

e AT, FraaTee Fried e Aifiad, St ww o, e |
HE g AT / aRET Herds (flendy) sia warE o |

THET T T/ BT TA, ol G AT |

99 ISR HrAerd g ﬁmaaﬁaﬁ?ﬁwwﬁumﬁuaﬁmw
g@‘ \,._,f

= 0k =

Desktop/Dinesh2020/Letter 2020




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

Comparative Statement of Previous Tender Documents & Proposed Tender Documents

S.No. |Criteria Existing Provision in Tenders of M.P.WRD Proposed Modification in Tenders of M.P.WRD
A. Modifications Proposed in all types of Tenders
1 GST Clause A. The Bid price quoted by the contractor shall deemed to be A. The Bid price quoted by the contractor shall deemed to be inclusive of

inclusive of all taxes viz. GST Income Tax, Labour Cess, Duties, Income Tax, Labour Cess, Duties, Royalties and other Taxes whatsoever on all
Royalties and other taxes, fees of central and state government, labour, material and equipment’s that the contractor will procure for the
local bodies and authorities whatsoever on all works contract performance of this contract, except “GST on works contract services”.
services, labour, material and equipment that the contractor will  |Payment of “GST on works contract services” shall be paid separately to the
procure for the performance of this contract (As per order contractor as per prevailing rate at the time of raising of bill/invoice by the
362/271/e.td/2018-19/3659 dt 24.04.2018) contractor.
B. If during the implementation of contract, the rate of GST on B. The liability, if any, on account of increase in all types of taxes inclusive

works contract service is reduced from the prevailing rate (ason  |Income Tax, Labour Cess, Royalties, all types of fees of Central and State

the last date of submission of bid) then the difference of GST on government, Local bodies and Authorities whatsoever on all works, contract
work contracts service rates will be recovered from the date on services, labour, material and equipment that the contractor will procure for
which the reduction in GST rates shall be effective. Similarly, if GST |the performance of this contract, except GST shall be borne by the contractz-
rates increases the additional increased amount, as per actual, will
be paid to the agency. (As per order 22 A 326-A/ MPS/31/471 dt

24.03.2022)
2 |Additional To restrict the bidders from quoting unworkable rates, the bidder |To restrict the bidders from quoting unworkable rates, the bidder shall
| Performance |have to pay additional performance security amount equals to the [to pay additional performance security amount equals to the differen
Security difference of 15% less than PAC and contract amount quoted by 90% amount of PAC and contract amount quoted by bidder in Item R
bidder. (as per GoMP order No. 22(A)/ 326 / MPS/31/2074, Percentage Rate/ Turnkey Tenders.
Bhopal, dated 17/10/2016 and amended order 14.06.2021 and
06.09.2021.)

B. Modifications Proposed in Tenders of Major/Medium Projects only

Volume-| Section-Il, Pre-Qualification criteria clause | Financial Criteria-

3 fArmual ‘The Bidder should have, in last three financial years audited:- The Bidder should have, in last five financial years audited:-
|turnover |1.1 Average Annual Turnover-The bidder or JV should have 1.1 Average annual turnover-The bidder or JV should have Aver
clause 1.1 Annual Turnover equal to or more than 50% of PAC in last |Turnover equal to or more than 50% of PAC in last 5 financial ye

3 financial y

The turnover of the years prior to current year shall be given weight
prior to current year shall be given 10% per year to bring them to current price level.
1 to current price level. # In case of Joint Venture, lead partner must meet criteria fully.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

S.No. |Criteria Existing Provision in Tenders of M.P.WRD Proposed Modification in Tenders of M.P.WRD

4 |[Net Worth Net worth of the bidder {and each partner of JV in case of JV) of No Changes Proposed
(paid up share |last 3 financial years should be positive and Net Worth of the

capital + bidder or JV of last Financial Year should not be less than 10% of

reserves & PAC.

surplus) Certificate from a Chartered Accountant should be submitted.

5 Not suffer The bidder (and Lead partner in case of JV) should not have No Changes Proposed

Loss suffered loss in more than one financial year during last 3 financial
years due to any reasons whatsoever.
Note: Certificate of C.A. to this effect should be uploaded

6 |Bid Capacity |Bid Capacity- Bid Capacity of the bidder or JV should be equal to or | Bid Capacity- Bid Capacity of the bidder or JV should be equal to or greater

clause 1.4 greater than PAC. Evaluation of Bid Capacity: than PAC. Evaluation of Bid Capacity:
Bid Capacity =2 X Ax B—C. Where: Bid Capacity=2 XAx B~=C.
A = Maximum Turnover in any one year during the last 3 years Where:
(10%weightage per year shall be given to bring the value of work A = Maximum Turnover in any one year during the last 3 years (10%
executed to the current price level) weightage per year shall be given to bring the value of work executed to the
B =Prescribed completion period in years for the subject contract. |current price level)
C = Balance amount of contract work in hand to be executed B = Prescribed completion period in years for the subject contract.
during the contract period. C = Balance amount of contract work in hand
« The assessed value of Bid Capacity of bidder or JV should not be |The assessed value of Bid Capacity of bidder or JV should not be less than
less than amount put to tender i.e. PAC amount put to tender i.e. PAC
Note: * In case of Joint Venture, each partner individually must fulfil requirement
Only Audited Balance Sheet or CA certificate based on Audited of bid capacity in proportion to their sharein JV.
Balance Sheet shall be considered. Provisional balance sheet will  |Note:
not be considered. Only Audited Balance Sheet or CA certificate based on Audited Balance Sheet

shall be considered. Provisional balance sheet will not be considered.

Jy

t I
e ¥ flc : G

Shishir Kushwaha

Engineei-ln-Chief




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

| S.No. |Criteria

Existing Provision in Tenders of M.P.WRD

Proposed Modification in Tenders of M.P.WRD

Volume-I Section-Il, Pre-Qualification criteria clause Il Physical Criteria-

For Major Projects

7 Physical

The bidder or JV should have executed in last 5 financial years as
stipulated below-

1. Micro lift irrigation Project - A and (B or C)

2. Dam/Barrage and Micro lift irrigation Project with power house -
A, B, Cand D

3. Micro liftirrigation Project without power house - A, B and C

4. Dam/Barrage with power house - Cand D

Where,

A = Construction of Micro Irrigation/ pipe network of Minimum
CCA (physical arable land covered by irrigation) of 3,000 ha. having
minimum head discharge of 1.0 cumecs in a single contract.

B = Construction of New Irrigation canal/Pipe network of CCA
(physical arable land covered by irrigation) not less than 15000 ha
OR 50% of required CCA whichever is less in maximum two
contracts together.

C = Created storage capacity of 100 MCM OR 50% of designed
‘;capacwty whichever is less in single reservoir.

D = Executed complete work including commissianing of power
house or pump house of 50% capacity of proposed power in a
single contract.

The bidder or JV should have executed in last 5 financial years as stipulated
below-

1. Pressurised pipe irrigation pr.
2. Dam/ Barrage - C only + (35%
20% of PAC divided by no of y
years)

3. Dam/Barrage with pressu gation Project-A and (B or D) and C
4, Dam/Barrage with Power H t-Cand D.

Where,

A = Design, Construction a
minimum CCA (physical ar.
of required CCA having minimu
minimum in a single contr.
B = Design, Construction a
CCA (physical arable land
50% of required CCA w
C = Created storage cap

hout headworks- A and (B or D)
ties of items, constituting more than
one year during last five financial

from new pressurised pipe network for
ed by irrigation) of 15000 ha OR 35%
2ad discharge of 1.50 cumecs, whichever is

on from new irrigation canal network of
v irrigation) not less than 10,000 ha OR
n single contract.

CM OR 50% of designed capacity

whichever is |ess in sing
D=Executed complete vors
house of 35% capacity ¢’ ¢
Note: In case of Joint
than 26% shall not be

g commissioning of power house or pump
sed power in a single contract,

, qualification of any JV partner with share less
nto consideration for evaluation purpose.

4

EEw) \(L/




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

stipulated below-

1.Micro lift irrigation Project - Aand (B or C)

2. Dam/Barrage and Micro lift irrigation Project with power house
A, B,Cand D

3. Micro lift irrigation Project without power house- A, B and C

4. Dam/Barrage with power house - Cand D

Where,

A = Construction of Micro Irrigation/ pipe network of Minimum

minimum head discharge of 0.35 cumecs in a single contract.

B = Construction of New Irrigation canal/Pipe network of CCA
(physical arable land covered by irrigation) not less than 5000 ha
OR 50% of required CCA whichever is less in maximum two
contracts together,

C = Created storage capacity of 20 MCM OR 50% of designed
capacity whichever is more in single reservoir.

D= Executed complete work including commissioning of power
house or pump house of 50% capacity of proposed power in a
single contract,

CCA (physical arable land covered by irrigation) of 1,000 ha. having

S.No. |Criteria Existing Provision in Tenders of M.P.WRD | Proposed Modification in Tenders of M.P.WRD
For Medium Projects
8 Physical The bidder or JV should have executed in last 5 financial yearsas | The bidder or JV should have executed in last 5 financial years as stipulated

below-

1. Pressurized pipe irrigation project without headworks -A and {B or D}

2. Dam/ Barrage - C only + (35% of quantities of items, constituting more than
20% of PAC divided by no of years in any one year during last five financial
years)

3. Dam/Barrage with pressurized pipe irrigation Project - Aand (B or D) and C
4, Dam/Barrage with power house - Cand D

Where,

A= Design, Construction and Irrigation from New pressurised pipe network
for minimum CCA (physical arable land covered by irrigation) of 2000 ha OR
35% of required CCA having minimum head discharge of 0.35 cumecs,
whichever is minimum in a single contract.

B = Design, Construction and Irrigation from New Irrigation canal network of
CCA (physical arable land covered by irrigation) not less than 5000 ha OR 50%
of required CCA whichever is less in single contract.

C = Created storage capacity of 20 MCM OR 50% of designed capacity
whichever is more in single reservoir.

D= Executed complete work including commissioning of power house or
pump house of 35% capacity of proposed power in a single contract.

Note: In case of Joint Venture, qualification of any JV partner with share less
than 26% shall not be taken into consideration for evaluation purpose.

%!

Shishir Kushwaha

Engineer-In-Chief




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

receipt of Bank Guarantee (BG), Previous Security Deposit (SD)shall
be released in accordance with Provision of Clause 108.20 of the
agreement.

| S.No. |Criteria Existing Provision in Tenders of M.P.WRD Proposed Modification in Tenders of M.P.WRD

9 1.V. following |NO SUCH PROVISIONS Note-
conditions 1. The lead partner/ Partner in charge in JV shall be fully responsitie far i-=
and execution of work defined. If, any of the partner fails to perform the c=* - =
requirements role, other partners shall perform all obligation under the contract in i~ =

|must be defined period, irrespective of their share in JV. In case of failure
fulfilled action shall be taken against all JV Partners irrespective of their rols g
responsiblities mentioned in JV Agreement.
2. Non-fulfilment of conditions stipulated in Annexure-G may lead tc
disqualification of the bidder/ JV at any stage.

10 |Paymentfor [Payment against procurement of and construction of components Payment for procurement & construction work of pressurised pipe irr 227
Procurement |of pressurized pipe irrigation system shall commence only after system shall be allowed up-to 20% cost of the Unit-Il (Canal- pres
& Forest clearance of Dam seat, approval of GAD and completion of |system) only after obta environment clearance, stage-| fores
Construction |Dam work upto 1.00 meter over and above foundation level in and approval of GAD, until concrete work is completed upto foun
of Pressurized |minimum 50% width of main River/Nalla portion of respective plus 1.00 meter he in at least 35% length of respective dam.The 3
Piped Dam. Payment against procurement of materials at any point of shall be in readin h completion of survey and investigatio
Irrigation time shall not exceed 20% of contract amount of Pressurized piped |approval of design and drawing of pressurized piped irrigation The
|System irrigation system. The contractor shall be in readiness with land acquisition for ¢ nergence and pressurized piped irr

completion of survey, investigatios and approval of design and system shall go simu
drawing of Pressurised piped irrigation system etc. the land

acquisition of dam, submergence and Pressurised piped irrigation

system shall go simultaneously.

11 |OTHER The contractor shall be required to submit afresh Bank Guarantee |The contractor shall be required to submit afresh Bank Guarantee (BG, of 5%:
SPECIAL (BG) of Rs. 5.00 Crore or 10% of operation and maintenance cost |of operation and main ance cost for next 5 years and extended 5 y T
CONDITIONS [for extended 5 years, whichever is more. This shall be released not |shall be released not be |
OF CONTRACT |before 90 days after the successful completion of O&M warks and |works and handing over the project to department in sound po 4 |

handling over the project to department in sound position. After  |receipt of Bank Guarantee (BG), Previous Security Deposit (SD) shall be

released in accordance with Provision of Clause 108.2 of the agreement

b

ER )




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

s o]

12 PRICE
ADJUSTMENT
work i.e building work:

Existing Provision in Tenders of M.P.WRD

For Construction Work-
Price adjustment component for construction and commisioning

No Changes Proposed

s, bridge work, canal work (earthwork,

lining and all structure), canal earthwork only, drilling and

grouting, earth dam work

s, Masonary, concrete dam work,

fabrication,supply and errection,

Tunnel works, pressurized pipe

irrigation system, composite d

am are defined as per order

374/271/e.td/enc/18-19/3555 bhopl dt 06.04.2018 in which POL,
LABOUR, PLANT MACHINERY SPARES percentage is fixed and
cement, steel, bitumen, HDPE and other material percentages are
calculated in Ratio of cost of component to the amount put to
tender.

For Management, Operation and Maintenance Work-

i No such Provision S.No.

1
2

\
\ - Plant and Machinery Spares —
Pp

| L R

BE)

Component
Labour - PI

POL- Py

&

percentage of componentin
the work
60%

20%

Proposed Modification in Tenders of M.P.WRD

\
|

Kushwaha

ser-In-Ghiel




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

T 5. | 22/2026/801/31 faHiw e | /0472026

TSR ST, el A fAUTT GRT SR SR 35, 22A/326/T-MPS 148/31/
HIOTer {1 08.02.2024 & He U & Wb, 02 TR IR AR WHRAT A
" (Additional Performance Guarantee)%ﬂﬁ%ﬂ?ﬁmﬁwm T ST &:-
o fAfaar & 10 uftmd &9 R WIa 89 R B sifiag wekdy Mt 5t
IR 7 for ST R
o fAfaeT & 10 9 20 URE 7 1 & o W AR &% 10 URNT @ 52w
forat ofrera o Bt PAC AT 1 Ta wiiw efifed ot
BT IR AR 8l -

SETERU- AfE fAfdeT BT g TR (PAC) Rs. 100,00 ONE § qor SwEAH
fAfderr ®F 2 14 TR Below SOR B Y eiffvad wwkas et o
Wﬁ'ﬁlﬂﬂﬁmz-

U R, & =Y H TRGd B ST arelt S Rt T a8 -
Probable Amount of Contract (PAC)X Rates Below SOR Beyond 10%=100
(14%-10%) = Rs. 4.00 TG

o Ffaar & 20 ftrerd § oifder H &R (Rates Below SOR Beyond 20%) 3
TR 3ifeifeer TR AT MRS TURT FrEER E-

SETRUL- AfE e $ SgEfa TP (PAC) Rs. 100,00 TR 2 9T THadH
fAfdeTeny 1 X 24 TR Below SOR 81 dF sififkad wwiAy TR 78
TUAT =R g
UG SR, & 9 H UK B 51 a1l sififvad wwwid TiRet 9 ufy -
A+B

A. Probable Amount of Contract X1 X Rates Below SOR Beyond 10% upto
20%) = 100x1X(10%)= Rs. 10.00 T




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

B. Probable Amount of Contract X2 X Rates Below SOR Beyond
20%=100x2x (4%)= Rs. 8.00 IRg
31yfd Pt sifafad wRoplAg TRE 9 IR (A+B)=Rs, 18.00 TG

g 3Mex f&A1w 01/04/2026 F wHTa<lia 81|
ALY & 59U & A9 J
AT SHTCATR
N J,/
(;9_0 i
@Wmdlalm
nmﬁmw
SId 1Y faumT Harery
A o 122 /2026/81/31 fami® o | /04/2026
afeferf:-
T ST, STeT Smer i3y, Hire|

1
2. AR A /AR Herers, Set e Y, mermd)

3. srefleror gl sifafvad ufvdiomT Seres, St SHTYE HUge, HerR )
4,

5

T BRI AT/ UREISHT WIS, Siet SaTe TR, HemR|

99 AR, wrafery Wi St TS T faHm, Hiore Bt 3R vy 9da
¥ yelRia 3 g4

5
v

el ST YR J3rer




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

30 J9EES www.govipress.mp.gov.in
g of TRA @S e o wE

[

FHHF 250] AT, Hean, T 9 faTmr 2025—9TK 18, TR 1947

fafyr afiR faurd w6 faum
W,%r’msfw«‘ﬂzozs

%, 8590-159-3FEH-31 (W.).—weawey faum ww 1 Fefafea sfufm fm = i 3 faesr, 2005
T TEIR $1 SFAfd WA € T ¢, TAegn wdueny s SHER & el e fR s e

TAYEH F TS F A Y AU ACAIA,
: AR, . e, Afifiad wiem,

499




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

TEAYST o, faie 9 Rigmy 2025

500 (3)

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 18 or 2025
THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025

| Received the assent of the Governor on the 3™ September, 2025; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)™, dated the 9 September, 2025. |

An Act further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to the
State of Madhya Pradesh.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment)
Act, 2025.

(2) Tt shall come into force from the date of its publication in the
Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

2. The Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (II of 1899) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner
hereinafter provided.

3. In Schedule I-A to the principal Act,-

(1) in article 5, in column (2), for the words "fifty rupees", the words "two
hundred rupees" shall be substituted.

(2) in article 6,-
(i) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (e), in column (2), for the words "one thou-
sand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(if) in clause (gb), for sub-clause (i) and (ii), the following sub-clauses shall
be substituted, namely,-

"(i) If contract value One thousand rupeces
is upto fifty lakh rupees.

(ii) If contract value 0.2 percent of contract
exceeds fifty lakh rupees. value subject to a maximum
of rupees ten lakh.".

(iii) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
"(h) If not otherwise provided for,-

(i) Where value is involved. Rupee one for every
ten thousand rupees or part
thereof of the value, subject
to a minimum of one thousand
rupees.

(i) For the cases not One thousand rupees."”.
covered by (i) above.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Central Act 1I
of 1899 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of

Schedule I-A.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

500 (4) AT Yo, fae o RaEs 2025
3) in article 24, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the

words "five housand rupees" shall be substituted.

4) in article 32, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

) after sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of article 38, the following sub-clause
shall be added, namely:-
"(ii1)  for mining leases not 2% of the whole amount payable
covered by (i) and (ii) or deliverable under such lease.".
above.

©) in article 41-A,-

1) in sub-clause (i) of clause (a), in column (2), for the words "five
thousand rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees” shall be substi-
tuted.

(i1) in sub-clause (i) of clause (a), in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(iii) in sub-clause (i) of clause (b), in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

(iv) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (b), in column (2), for the words
"one thousand rupees", the words "two thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

() in article 48, in column (1), in explanation-1, after the word "grandson",
the words "and in the event of death of brother, his wife and children"
shall be added.

(8) in article 49,-

1) in sub-clause (a) of clause A, in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(i1) in sub-clause (b) of clause B, in column (2), for the words "one

thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

{9) in article 50,-

(1) in clause (a), in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(i1) in clause (b), in column (2), for the words "two thousand
rupees” the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(iii) in clause (d), in sub-clause (i), in column (2) for the words
"one thousand rupees" the words "two thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.




N.L.T. No. 628/2715001/E.D.P./2021-22/E-in-C/e-tendering/ Dated 27.04.2026

qeuSe wrores, feie o R 2028 500 (5)

(10)

(11

(12)

(iv) in clause (), in column (2) for the words "one hundred rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

() in clause (f), in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

in article 53, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

in article 60, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees”, the
words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

in article 63, in clause B, in column (2), for the words "One thousand
rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

e, T@ RO TR dE A, TN §RT NS S gEoer, ﬂhqmﬁgﬁaﬁmﬁ%ﬁw—zozs:_

Signature Not Verified
Digitally signed by‘ NIL RAWAT

Date: 2026.04.30 18:16;
Location: Madhya Pr




		2026-04-30T18:16:47+0530
	Madhya Pradesh-MP
	SUNIL RAWAT




